I . S.uA.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

JIIRdd = IS4 d

Che Gazette of India

Y.SM.-21.TeA.-31.-05102020-222257
CG-DL-E-05102020-222257

STETYTIT
EXTRAORDINARY
AWM 1I—E'8 3—39-9Us (ii)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (ii)

IIfeRTE & TFTirT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 3085] 7% Taeht, THaTR, STEEx 5, 2020/5MRaT 13, 1942
No. 3085] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, OCTOBER 5, 2020/ASVINA 13, 1942
T
(¥, FR i) g fawm)
JTeeT

< faeett, 5 sFqaY, 2020

T, 3465(3).—F= 1T ALHE, TH-FLHIT TS Ara=ad, 2019 (2019 =1 34) &t &7 96
ZIT W& ATl oY =0 AT 36 q80e a9 ATt g 97 orf<FaT &1 TN Fd gu, STE-HeHiT 99
TSTEA & gag H Auferied sraer et 2, stei-

1. (1) =9 e &1 "o 98 Trg-Fefie 9 TsgeT e (e fBfest 1 saqgam) G
#Ter, 2020 |

(2) 72 T T &0 |

2. AT G AT, 1897 TH Q9T & [Ha= & o7 39 &1 AR[ S, SH g WILd AT
# wg fafat & foro Re=w F P ang grar 2 1

3. AT TATT | TH AR AT AT | et Afa=aw, S % Ivg 949 g g2 a1 57
qeAR IR FIRT i a7 denfaa a8 w¢ AT S1ar 8, 39 a9 v TeE g Maford gt
ST AT o T T@d gu TATET g A7 At zaw var et o war g, a1 et g s

4. ST =9 AT § vAT srqtera g T T efafRew & G ARt g 31 ser anr § st
T Qe T 9T KT oeg giaeeriad o smow a1 Fw{qus sy oreai F7 «a B S 7@,
ForiReta, TET TiaeaTae A1 A, F gt F Farr St s iy w9 9 Suafad 8, gt el 39 4T v
I T § 3rar g, e ersat & = 9 B Stros |

4733 G1/2020 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

5. T SATReT F UH U, ST et fafer 7 s1eaetsy e €, I7 SEaRT AT IUTa<r A1 Hvas #:3d
S 57 oY O § ettt G s o Sed tar sigee Seer g ar o Bfe S aefie ar
fSreeh ST S orfeRat waFT=T 21, 31 9pa, 2019 F Tgel TV F w9 F IHTs T AT TR T TS FReT
rferg=T, straer, wiaagar, e, Iutafy, Fae a1 AfFae w1 7 avrs w7 & 7 Bt ara & sfatemm
TRl AT, ST UHT foheft stfere=e, saer, staasar, Tenl, sarare, =, e a1 Bt ara &1 3= &t
OfF 7, SHT fawar o, sfiw a7 & aRfeafaat § 39 21 Tiaegaor, BRI a1 JFd T ST a1 /11 98
AT ITTAHTLT FIET TH Q9T & W & TATG ¥ UH qTH & 39 q7T AN ST F FTHAT F«19T I97
2, ST fo s g e = En

6. (1) =0 smaer Fit st § fAafAtae fft f&fer w1 Feas = gemge -

(&) =& T AR reft ffer % qdadt s o1 seeh s qeeh =9 & iy 7 47 qed B T
Y ara =;

(@) == v Afaa T @t % sefa stfom, s ar Suwa Bt stfeerre, farerteem,
FTEAAT IT JTAA

() ==y Ao et f&fer & g s ot sraery o w9y & Soerq fereft ermfea, v eoT
7 3T F;

(FT) TATqE Tk et UF srtereTe, fAaurfasre, areqar , et aied, 999eLor a1 8 & gad |
F1E sreaoor, F3feres Frdaret I Su=Te A,

TATIAT qg! HT A UH Rt steawor, fafas wrdarsr 97 ST &l 99 g |fe9d, ST a7 Jaiad a1
STT FT 3T UET et orfRa, aHaeeor a7 &€ &1 a9 & ATSod T ST FoT AT SF-H9HiT Tiiod
Ffaraaw, 2019 (2019 FT 34) IT T TSN ITHA AT SATLT AT AT AT 2T |

(2) 3 T2 (1) F St F wefi Tgd gu G U e 3 arefiw fy g A = fwly wrars
F (Sraek siasta Y 72 &g RgRe a7 o, S srerg=ET, seer a7 e, At g, safafe ar
ThIH, ST TATora, foam w7 9xfve a1 ssta A gt R a1 Forfed #w oft 8) -
FOHIT T TTGF &1 qadT H faearid ofiw @y fwi &fdr & qoearet suasi & stefiq &t 78 qoeAt
ST ST T T Tk T a1 TEHT STl T A § SO F9HIE & Tsqer o forw feaqriea Fur
farfer & orefie 7 < FoFelt a1 A1 FaTE ERT 9 AT ftsd Agl Y [QAT AT g |
STTEA 1
(CRUREC)
g fafeat
1. stfafafaa Feg =fe arEdt sfefaem, 2019
(2019 %7 21)

g 2. - @< (1) § ITEE (jii) # “ofT” F AT F2 3T =7 T A7 Ffog suEe (ji) F 781
Areterfea sia:cenfoa 9, -

“(iiiTh) ST-FeTIT T TTAT, 39 T TS0 il L A |

*kkkkhkkhhkhk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST TETLTIOT 3

2. A 3 = SRR FHH (R T aarad [fRgae) atafa, 1996
(1996 FT 27)
T 49% & TLATT 7S, &1 HT ST TATIT — GTT 49 F TAT AT TATIT FL —

SALTEN T WA “49%F. (1) &TIT 47, &7 48 3T oTT 49 F el S+ et sra=rer 71, stfererse
AT FIA F @ AT IHH TAT, ATHFHAT STITeN F Sraa a2 UH sferawreyt a1
sTrerRTEr 3T o s g, e § sfeeEEr g 3w At fffde w2,
THATH T T & ST ol T hl TohH o e FIT THA TR ST T ;

T AT ST, TS § SEEEAT g 36 YR (AT Yo T R A Soad w7
TR

TRq Tg A T U S SraeredT gy A9 7 AT qaEsl 9% o T GHI W STITd e
T 2 :

Ui g AT UH SOel T GAHAT FA ATHHAT AT g UH ATAFET AT Ay F U
THTETANR &9 | HTd HIA & THT ol HAT STUIT o TAT TITE 3R 3T ST Tt LT |

(2) ST&T ITETT (1) Tl TFeft sTa=rer &1 Sorse 3T 1T € gt UH Tu<Ter & "ag § et
g o T wEarfatr w8t ft oIy s sraeeft, =ty srfewer € 8, v Fet=a/sea ww
STTUATT |

*kkkkkkkkkkkkkkk

3. &1 =W (RfFwe ik semew) sifaf=am, 1970
(1970 %7 37)

g1 - IT4RT (4) F G (F) § “dE” 03 & TIH I “ATA | 9758 7 |
&TT 25 3 TATA T3 1T T AT —

STALTEN T TLHT “25%. T 22 FT ITLTT (1) 3T STLTIT (2) TAT &TT 24 F el == oFely srowrer
T, SATHATSTT AIRAT FIA o TF AT IHb THT ATTR(AT STILTET % e % v
AfepTr AT Iy g S " avan a9 § A= g 39
At AR w5, = f aroft 7 ot o = F oo gaaa B s

TRTT, 37T -
IR
FH AT | G JUHA T TS TR
1 2 3
1 22(1), 22(2) i | 3T H Aarora FT<l it fem o rfere Agl giir
24 1950 5000/- =7
51 % 100 8,000/- =97
101 & 500 12,000/- ¥
500 & rfer 16,000/- &7




4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

T AT EEE, TSI § AfSgEAr grr awet § AfAfEe goma fit @ Fr gentaa w7
EEDIIE
g T A TF U g sraredt g 9 7 Aferew aest 97 U U a9 IH o oy yerHA
SRR
i qg ot TH STOeTell T YT Ao AR orawTelt g U eAfawrer Ar i % U
AATLTANE & H HTF F7 o THT f (AT SITUIT 7o UHT ST927er 3117 3% ST T2t 1T |

g T W T T STI2Td 7 WA q&F HASTH AT SHaTe # & 9¥ AT SIrav g af Sed Jred
T T LA FT TAgea? TTA9rd Faterd FHAT T Facd AT SITUAT IT FHATAT § I1aT The &
T AT ST ST afe A wHET ggEme R qgi 8 ar srfaer v v S § srar i ot S
T TR g Afg=d & 0 |

(2) STET 3T (1) o refie Foreft sTaerer =T Werse T3 1T € gt UF 1900 o 9ae | TureT
g o i FwTdaTRat 98t i ST &Y sy, afe srfeeear § 8, v At ar st #57 R
STTUATT 1)

*hkkkkkkkkkkkkhkk

4. FTLE@T A=, 1948
(1948 T 63)
"I 2 — G () & 39T (i) 3T IUEe (i) ¥ T ST “d9” % T 90 FALC A & “|rene”

|
€T 66 — ITLTT (1) F T (@) o T I¥ G -
“(=) Tt |t TamaETet § T TR F GHAT 6 (o0 FATSIT gl ghaT gl 3T Sva, S
TEATT | LT, ATH 3T F1 F Hel § "Hareq AT gar & refid W@ gu A7 [asa g
SAATAA T ST ATeAT TohelT 377 THT 91 o Srefie g gu, ST [AfRd if S0, 9T 6 &l & T8 3iY
T 7 T % T9ATq A HATTSa 6T ST FehT ;)

kkkkkkkkkkkkkhkkhkk

5. sren e faere stfafagw, 1947
(1947 = srfarfaas geai=T 14)
g 26 — IT4TT (3) | “fF a0 Tq19 9 “UF qu” 7 |
g 259 — @< () | “Ung fam” & o o2 e o o
T 252 — ITLTT (1) | “|Y” & T 9 “q1 91 9 |
1T 31 o THET A5 G & ST AT -

FALTEN T TLHT “31%F. &7 259, 91T 253, g1 259, 9T 26, 91T 27, 9T 28 3f¥ 41y 30F 4T
T 31 it ITYTT (1) 3T ITLTT (2) F e F==irr Fely sro=rer = srfsrrs=
HETT F3 o A AT I TAT ATHHIAT AU F SAEET 9 UH STehr a7
sTterRTT g o s "vw, o # srfaeEET g =w At AR w5y,
Fr=r 7 ATelt F Tl fAiEe vE @ F T v T ST He, e -



[T [I—=7F 3(ii)]

ATLT T TSI ; STHTETIT 5

qreft
T |, 1T TTHA T THH

1 2 3

1 257 T FHA G0 AT Te eAfad 25 fae &t 7asrgdr

2 253 TeU® FHHTL FIT AT T8 sifad 60 faa it gorgdy

3 257 (i) eI FHHR FRT 150/-%. wiafew g T f@emse 3000/-%. &
wfer T2 2t ;
(ii) F=rsT 3T 300/-%. wiafaa g T e = afsa = &
wfer T2 2t
SN H A wEwd A | " e agl gri
HqeqT
1950 5000/-=.
51 100 8000/-=.
101 & 500 12000/-%.
500 # srfer 16000/-%.

4 26 (i) sTaer gEaTer il T9T | To4F FHEAR g7 150/-%. Ffated &g
F foaTT 3000/-%.% Tfer Agi i
(ii) sTarer qTATERT AT F9T H R s geT 300/-%. wiafes &g
T THATRT A1 (0T T F STTEF Tl 2mil
AN H A wEwr A | R ateeE aal g
T
1% 50 5000/-%.
513 100 8000/-%.
101 & 500 12000/-%.
500 & srfar 16000/-%.

5 27 3fiT 28 SULIE 91T 26 % AT AL FEATA ST ATATERT & [ |

6 29 T FHA & qag H 200/-%. FfafaT |

7 30F T FHARC I AT T2 Afaw 25 o it Forg?l |

8 31(1) AN | AT | T8 s@8y | @ fadT | ST S|y
FHHTL T TEAqT
1950 5000/-%. 10,000/-%. 15,000/-%.
517 100 8000/-%. 16,000/-%. 24,000/-=.
101 & 500 12000/-%. 24,000/-=. 36,000/-=.
500 ¥ a1t 16000/-%. 32,000/-%. 48,000/-%.

9 31(2) (i) T FHFR & forT gger oraerg & forw 1,000/-%., THY 9T

3 forT 2,000/-%. 3T Srae sraere & forw 3,000/-%.
(O RERIEEE I i




6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

AN | Ao | Ugar seey | @R AaET | T ey
FHHRT Al qeaT

1950 1500/-=. 3,000/-%. 6,000/-%.
51 % 100 3000/-=. 6,000/-%. 10,000/-=.
101 & 500 4000/-=. 8,000/-%. 15,000/-=.
500 ¥ stfer 5000/-%. 10,000/-%. 20,000/-=.

U AT TR, TS H, ATEE=AT 1T, 3% aroit # AR wowe i v wir "ot w7
TR

g T A TF U g sraeredt g A9 7 Aferw qaesl 9 o U a9 TR R oy YerHA
T 2 |

g Tg AT ToF U ST=Tet T TeHT Faer ATHHRAT AT FRT UH ATAFET AT IIfEEE 6 uH
THTETAAR &9 | HTd FIA & THT ol HAT ST o TAT TITE 3R 3T ST Al LT |

g T W T T STaereg 7 WemT At e u AT AT 8 qv SEH AT T9HT 6 T
g FHATN Hl Haq il STTOIAT AT FHAE H FGa-a0aY Haq l SATUIAT T TG Fle HHABIL TgaT9
TR Tl § AT ATTAT THH T LRI FIT TAT ST AT H STHT T &F STUAAT |

(2) STET ITLTT (1) Tl TFeft sTa=rer &1 Sorse T 1T € gt UH (u=Tel & "ag § et
fo®g o &Y FrarRar a8 it ST i sy, 7t stfdwer & g, #1 Aeia/e== w7 &=
STTOATT 1)

*khkkkkkkkkkkkkk

6. =N s (vardft sew) sifafAesT, 1946
(1946 %7 20)
1T 139 o THT s & FH T AT -

QLT T T 137, 36 ATARAH F e devi Foheft srarer 71, Af e afaa 37 & 9@ a1 39
TATY ATHHAT AT F SAad 9 T3 g T90 6 &H & o UH
srferaRTy AT AT grr e aqi=a avar e § sfegEar gy 2"
e Pl w3, = g9 =99 F q4fed it 99T it H & q1 gRT
A ToRT ST T

TR AT G, TSI H ATIGEAT g7 390 AT T it T T F90TEd FT Tl :
TRq Fg A T U S SOt g A1 7 ATHE TaEal 9 U T FHIT W AT T
SEANE

Ui qg T UH STUTEl T WHT FAS ATHRIAT AT g UH AFAFEYT AT AIAFET F UE
TATLTANE & | HTF F7 6 THT ol (AT SITUIT o UHT STo27er 317 3% ST qgt 1T |

(2) ST&T ITLTT (1) Tl et STa=rer 7 Sorse 3T 19T € 9l UH (U0 & "ag § 90t &
=g T 3T FEATRAr el At ST i aret, Ffs dfawear § §, & [er=a/se=a w7 @
STTOATT 17 |

khkkkhkkkhkhkkkhkkhk




[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST TETLTIOT 7

7. Aie 9Ragd sHar AfafaawT, 1961
(1961 &7 27)
ST 34 F T AT EATIIT FY -

STALTEN T WA “347. (1) srfarfa=rm it & 29 T ITLmT (1), &1 31 37 &7 32 F a1 s+ fohet
SURTY T, ATHATST AT FA o6 I AT I8 THT ATHH AT AT o ST
I U STTARTET AT ITfEreRT< g, ford aef=ra aaTe Ters § ATE=eT g, =9
v FfAfEe w3, 99 9= *9F ¥ a=fas i ToAT fi T F G g
STeTHA TRt ST T

T FHET TR, TSI § ATAT=AT T FU¥ AR Tord it Tm iy Fefard wT qeit

TR Tg A TF U S ST gy 1 7 AT FEsl 9 U T FHIT T AT A
ST

Ui ag ot TH STOerell T YT el TR srawrel gy ud srfarawrd Ar wrfaery F UE
THTLTANE & § FHT FIA o6 THT &l HAT SITUAT T3 TAT ST SR 3T S A5l LT |

T T8 9T T ST sy &1 weme A & araad 9¥ AT Sar 8 a1 SHE Ied TeHe A T
FT TAZCAL T(A9Td HaTAd FHATC I, STET gl 1T BT Haed (hAT SATUIT IT FHA § FLaL a0 Iie
T ST T ATR 1S FHFHE TgaTT T0T Tal g af AT ToH FH =T T g T47 Atagf=a afa
T STHT T <7 SATUAT |

(2) ST&T ITETT (1) % e FoFeft sTa=rer a1 Sorse T 19T € gt UH STu<rel o "ag § TIeredT
g o sfiT FrraTeat 98t At ST e sy, 7T srfewer # g, v Awia/senta ww R
STTUATT 1)

*kkkkkkkkkkkkhkk

8. usit srfafaaw, 1948
(1948 1 8)
ST 32 F T TS 1T T HAFATIT -

SR-FHeiT Awstt afafRaw, “32w. gy 32 @ T a1 F g gu o uh Gl stE w, S 9w
gaq 2011 (1955 W) F FTE-FHIHT AUS(T stterf=ad, 2011 (1955 TEY) F e srqefara qus=At
aefiv WEhFa =t F % ower § safEse B @ § s S se afafRaw F aefie At
oy § faey Iusrer AT TE@AT 8, 1 S9a<t, 2020 & JTEH I ATl UF 99 %l (a(d & sfiav
= At B 0 sreEs % erefid Ygd gu Siw UHT i % 91 97 ST
SFL-HHT T AT F g g Afgd f S, =w afathaw w
AT 4 % e A foaT s i srgefera wosrs F T # gfase

f3FaT 9T =T ST 1)

*hkkkkkkkkhkkhkk



8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

9. fasrr Had =T (JaT <) Afafaw, 1976
(1976 %1 11)
#TT 9 o THTA A2 G T A FATIA -

AT T T “OF. (1) TH ATATTHT ¥ T 4, T 5 < 41T 7 AT 39 7l a970 70 [y
T =T FeT sroery 1, AT 6T A % 9F AT 39e 940,
SFTHR e sroereft 3 straae 9% U srfereRT<y A1 e gren, S e aweww
TS | ATEG=AT g1 =4 A fAfAfae 3, /= a9 =9 ¥ st goe
FT THH % HET G TEA TRAT ST T,

TR AT AT, TS H ATSH=AT g7 3aq [AAEE wordT it TR Fir deifed w7 e
TR Tg A TF U S ST gy 1 7 AT FEsl 9 U T FHIT T AT A
ST

i ag ot TH STOerell T YT At STIRiAa oraweht g U erfararer Ar wrfaeRr F U
THTLTANE & H HF FH7 o6 TAT of (AT SITUIT o UHAT STO27e 30 3% ST Tt 1T |

(2) STt STeTT (1) * i Torelt sTaerer 1 Serse 36T AT § Jgf UH STOerel & gael § Taeret
F faeg ST wraTEat dai il SATusT oY =Ty, #fq srfower & 8, &1 Auit=a a7 s &
ST 17

*kkkkkkkkkkkkkkk

10. o faskaT (AT e 3T v fAwg AfRew) sifaf@am, 2014
(2014 %7 07)
T 1 - ST (2) H “STH-FeHX 757 & [Harg” &1 a9 2|

8T 2 - UL (1) & E (F) % 7€ (i) § “faecdt aedra aroteri 7 e 1 a7 % 9997
ST T 79T & T TR AT F

kkkkkkkhkkkkkhkkk

11. =gy g9 Afaf[aw, 1926
(1926 T 16)
g1 9 FY TET- g1 9 & =« ) fR=fefaa @ -

TorEERor ST “9. T, AT 8 & M suaE Ty ' % TR u¥, 39 AfafHEw koo
Ut N T FA & AT Tgd gu o 7w 7 sAfaw f safy F ffaw
fafed wr=T § TREEHRTor SRS AT FT S TH G196 A qre
SN T3 0aETT 69 &l 36 ATIAIH % TefiT q90F &7 F TR ha #7 foram
TATE

[®1. 5. 11012/16/2020-TH=70)

ol pHIY ﬂv@l,ﬂgﬂlaa



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST TETLTIOT 9

MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS
(DEPARTMENT OF JAMMU, KASHMIR AND LADAKH AFFAIRS)
ORDER
New Delhi, the 5th October, 2020

S.0. 3465(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 96 of the Jammu and Kashmir
Reorganisation Act, 2019 (34 of 2019), and of all other powers enabling it in that behalf, the Central
Government hereby makes the following Order in respect of the Union territory of Jammu and
Kashmir, namely: —

1. (D) This Order may be called the Union Territory of Jammu and Kashmir
Reorganisation (Adaptation of Central Laws) Second Order, 2020.

2) It shall come into force with immediate effect.

2. The General Clauses Act, 1897 applies for the interpretation of this Order as it applies
for interpretation of laws in force in the territory of India.

3. With immediate effect, the Acts mentioned in the Schedule to this Order shall, until
repealed or amended by a competent Legislature or other competent authority, have effect, subject to
the adaptations and modifications directed by the Schedule to this Order, or if it is so directed, shall
stand repealed.

4. Where this Order requires that in any specified section or other portion of an Act, certain
words shall be substituted for certain other words, or certain words shall be omitted, such
substitution or omission, as the case may be, shall, except where it is otherwise expressly provided,
be made wherever the words referred to occur in that section or portion.

5. The provisions of this Order which adapt or modify any law so as to alter the manner in
which, the authority by which or the law under or in accordance with which, any powers are
exercisable, shall not render invalid any notification, order, commitment, attachment, bye-law, rule or
regulation duly made or issued, or anything duly done before the 31* day of October, 2019; and any
such notification, order commitment, attachment, bye-law, rule, regulation or anything may be
revoked, varied or undone in the like manner, to the like extent and in the like circumstances as if it
had been made, issued or done after the commencement of this Order by the competent authority and
in accordance with the provisions then applicable to such case.

6. (1) The repeal or amendment of any law specified in the Schedule to this Order shall not
affect—

(a) the previous operation of any law so repealed or anything duly done or suffered
thereunder;

(b) any right, privilege, obligation or liability acquired, accrued or incurred under any
law so repealed;

(c) any penalty, forfeiture or punishment incurred in respect of any offence committed
against any law so repealed; or

(d) any investigation, legal proceeding or remedy in respect of any such right, privilege,
obligation, liability, penalty, forfeiture or punishment as aforesaid,

and any such investigation, legal proceeding or remedy may be instituted, continued or enforced, and any
such penalty, forfeiture or punishment may be imposed, as if the Jammu and Kashmir Reorganisation
Act, 2019 or this Order had not been passed or issued.

(2) Subject to the provisions of sub-paragraph (1), anything done or any action taken
(including any appointment or delegation made, notification, instruction or direction issued, form,
bye-law or scheme framed, certificate obtained, permit or licence granted or registration effected or
agreement executed) under any such law shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the
corresponding provisions of the Central Laws now extended and applicable to the Union territory of
Jammu and Kashmir and shall continue to be in force accordingly unless and until superseded by
anything done or any action taken under the Central Laws now extended to the Union territory of
Jammu and Kashmir.



10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

THE SCHEDULE
(See Paragraph 3)
CENTRAL LAWS
1. THE BANNING OF UNREGULATED DEPOSIT SCHEMES ACT, 2019
(21 of 2019)
Section 2.— —In clause (1), in sub-clause (iii), omit “and” and after sub-clause (iii) as so omitted, insert—

“(iiia) the Union territory of Jammu and Kashmir, the Government of that
Union territory,; and”.

ook sk skok ok

2. THE BUILDING AND OTHER CONSTRUCTION WORKERS (REGULATION OF
EMPLOYMENT AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT, 1996

(27 of 1996)

Insertion of new section- After section 49, insert —

Compounding “49A.(1)Any offence punishable under sections 47, 48 and 49 may, either before or after

of offences. the institution of the prosecution, on an application by the alleged offender, be
compounded by payment of compounding amount not more than fifty thousand by such
officer or authority as the appropriate Government may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, specify in this behalf:

Provided that the appropriate Government may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, amend the compounding amount so specified:

Provided further that the offences of the same nature committed by the same
offender for more than three occasions shall not be compoundable:

Provided also that such offences shall be compounded only after the alleged
offender has acted to the satisfaction of such officer or authority that such offence is not
continued any further.

2) Where an offence has been compounded under sub-section (1), no further
proceedings shall be taken against the offender in respect of such offence and the offender,
if in custody, shall be released or discharged.”

sheskeoskoskeoskosk
3. THE CONTRACT LABOUR (REGULATION AND ABOLITION) ACT, 1970
(37 0f 1970)
Section 1. - In sub-section (4), in clause (a), for the word “twenty”, substitute the word “forty”.

Insertion of new section- After section 25, insert —

Compounding “25A.—(1) Any offence punishable under sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 22

of offences. and section 24 may, either before or after the institution of the persecution, on an
application by the alleged offender, be compounded by such officer or authority as
the appropriate Government may by notification in the Official Gazette, specify in
this behalf for such amount as specified in the Table below, namely:-

TABLE
S. No. Section Compounding amount
1 2 3
1 22(1), 22(2) and 24 Number of workmen employed in | Amount not exceeding
the industry




[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST TETLTIOT 11

1 to 50 Rs.5000/-

51 to 100 Rs. 8,000/-
101 to 500 Rs. 12,000/-
More than 500 Rs. 16,000/-:

Section 2.-

Section 66. -

Section 2A.-

Provided that the appropriate Government may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, amend the compounding amount specified in the said Table :

Provided further that the offences of the same nature committed by the same
offender for more than three occasions shall not be compoundable:

Provided also that such offences shall be compounded only after the alleged
offender has acted to the satisfaction of such officer or authority that such offence is not
continued any further:

Provided also that when an offence is compounded on an application by the
principal employer or contractor, then seventy- five per cent. of the compounding amount
received from him, shall be paid to the concerned employee or equally amongst the
employees and if the employees are not identifiable, then the remaining amount shall be
deposited in the manner as may be notified by the appropriate Government.

2) Where an offence has been compounded under sub-section (1), no further
proceedings shall be taken against the offender in respect of such offence and the offender,
if in custody, shall be released or discharged.”.

skokskskskskk
4. THE FACTORIES ACT, 1948
(63 of 1948)

In clause (m), in sub-clauses (i) and (ii), for “ten” and “twenty”, substitute “twenty” and
“forty” respectively.

In sub-section (1), for clause (b), substitude-

“(b) women shall be entitled to be employed in all establishments for all types of
work and they may also be employed, with their consent before 6 a.m. and beyond
7 p.m subject to such conditions relating to safety, holidays and working hours or
any other condition, to be observed by the employer, as may be prescribed;”.

shseoskoskoskokosk

5. THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES ACT, 1947
(14 of 1947)

In sub-section (3), for “three years”, substitute “one year”.

Section 25F.-In clause (b), for “fifteen days”, substitute the words “thirty days”.

Section 25K.-In sub-section (1), for “one hundred”, substitute “three hundred”.

Insertion of new section- After section 31, insert —

Compounding
of offences.

“31A.(1) Any offence punishable under sections 25Q , 25R, 25U, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30A
and sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 31 may, either before or after the institution of
the prosecution, on an application by the alleged offender, be compounded by such
officer or authority as the appropriate Government may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, specify in this behalf for such amount as specified in the Table below, namely:-




12

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

TABLE

S.No.

Section

Compounding amount

2

3

25Q

25 days wages last drawn by each workman.

25R

60 days wages last drawn by each workman.

25U

(i) By each workman Rs.150/- per day but not exceeding Rs. 3000/-
in aggregate;

(i1)) By employer Rs.300/- per day but not exceeding the amount in
aggregate as shown below:

Number of workmen Amount not exceeding
employed in the industry

1 to 50 Rs. 5000/-

51 to 100 Rs. 8000/-

101 to 500 Rs. 12000/-

More than 500 Rs. 16000/-

26

(1) In case of illegal strike, Rs.150/- per day by each workman but not
exceeding Rs.3000/- in aggregate;

(i) In case of illegal lock-out Rs. 300/- per day by an employer but not
exceeding the amount in aggregate as shown below:

Number of workmen Amount not exceeding
employed in the industry

1 to 50 Rs. 5000/-

51 to 100 Rs. 8000/-

101 to 500 Rs. 12000/-

More than 500 Rs. 16000/-

27 and 28

As per section 26 above for illegal strike and lockout.

29

Rs. 200/- per day in respect of each of the workman.

30A

25 days wages last drawn by each workman.

31(1)

Number of For first For second occasion For third

workmen occasion occasion
employed in
the industry

1 to 50 Rs. 5000/- Rs. 10,000/- Rs. 15,000/-

51 to 100 Rs. 8000/- Rs. 16,000/- Rs.24,000/-

101 to 500 Rs. 12000/- Rs.24,000/- Rs.36,000-

More than 500 | Rs. 16000/- Rs.32,000- Rs.48,000/-




[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST TETLTIOT 13

9

31(2) (i) For each workman, for the first offence Rs.1000/- for the second
offence Rs.2000/- and for the third offence Rs.3000/-
(i) For employer:
Number of For first For second For third
workmen occasion occasion occasion
employed in the
industry
1 to 50 Rs. 1500 Rs. 3000 Rs. 6000
51 to 100 Rs.3000 Rs.6000 Rs.10000
101 to 500 Rs.4000 Rs.8000 Rs.15000
More than 500 Rs.5000 Rs.10000 Rs.20000:

Provided that the appropriate Government may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, amend the compounding amount specified in the said Table :

Provided further that the offences of the same nature committed by the same
offender for more than three occasions shall not be compoundable:

Provided also that such offences shall be compoundable only after the alleged
offender has acted to the satisfaction of such officer or authority that such offence is not
continued any further:

Provided also that when an offence is compounded on an application by the
employer, then the compounding amount received from him, shall be paid to the
concerned workman or equally amongst the workmen and if any workmen are not
identifiable, then the remaining amount shall be deposited in such manner as may be
notified by the appropriate Government.

(2) Where an offence has been compounded under sub-section (1), no further proceedings
shall be taken against the offender in respect of such offence and the offender, if in custody,
shall be released/discharged.”.

st sfeskoskeoskosk

6. THE INDUSTRIAL EMPLOYMENT (STANDING ORDERS) ACT, 1946
(20 of 1946)

Insertion of new section- After section 13B insert-

Compounding “13C.(1) Any offence punishable under the Act may, either before or after the institution

of offences.

of the prosecution, on an application by the alleged offender, be compounded by payment
of compounding amount of not more than rupees fifty thousand, by such officer or
authority as the appropriate Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette,
specify in this behalf for the amount of rupees fifty thousand:

Provided that the appropriate Government may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, amend the said specified compounding amount:

Provided further that the offences of the same nature committed by the same
offender for more than three occasions shall not be compoundable:

Provided also that such offences shall be compounded only after the alleged
offender has acted to the satisfaction of such officer or authority that such offence is not
continued any further.




14

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

(2) Where an offence has been compounded under sub-section (1), no further proceedings
shall be taken against the offender in respect of such offence and the offender, if in
custody, shall be released or discharged.”.

skok ks ok skok

7. THE MOTOR TRANSPORT WORKERS ACT, 1961
(27 of 1961)

After section 34, insert —

Compounding of
offences.

“34A.(1)Any offence punishable under sub-section (1) of section 29, section 31 and
section 32 may, either before or after the institution of the prosecution, on an
application by the alleged offender, be compounded by payment of compounding
amount not more than five thousand rupees, by such officer or authority as the
appropriate Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify in this
behalf:

Provided that the appropriate Government may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, amend the compounding amount specified above:

Provided further that the offences of the same nature committed by the same
offender for more than three occasions shall not be compoundable:

Provided also that such offences shall be compounded only after the alleged
offender has acted to the satisfaction of such officer or authority that such offence is
not continued any further:

Provided also that when an offence is compounded on an application by the
employer, then seventy-five per cent of the compounding amount received from him,
shall be paid wherever it is feasible to the concerned worker or equally amongst the
workers and if any workmen are not identifiable then the remaining amount shall be
deposited in such manner as may be notified by the appropriate Government.

(2) Where an offence has been compounded under sub-section (1), no further
proceedings shall be taken against the offender in respect of such offence and the
offender, if in custody, shall be released/discharged.”.

skokskskskskk
8. THE PHARMACY ACT, 1948
(8 of 1948)

Insertion of new section- After section 32, insert —

Special provisions “32C. Notwithstanding anything contained in section 32, any person whose
regarding persons name has been entered in the register of pharmacists maintained under the
registered under the Jammu and Kashmir Pharmacy Act, 2011 (1955 A.D) and possesses
Jammu and Kashmir qualification prescribed under the said Act shall be deemed to have been

Pharmacy

Act, entered in the register of pharmacists prepared and maintained under Chapter

Samvat, 2011 (1955 IV of this Act, subject to an application to be made in this behalf within a

A.D).

period of one year commencing from the 31% October, 2020 and payment of
such fee as may be prescribed by the Government of Union territory of Jammu
and Kashmir.”.

skoskoskoskoskokosk



[T [I—=7F 3(ii)]

ATLT T TSI ; STHTETIT 15

9. THE SALES PROMOTION EMPLOYEES ACT, 1976
(11 of 1996)

Insertion of new section- After section 9, insert —

Compounding
of offences.

“9A.(1)Any offence punishable under sections 4, 5 and 7 or any rules made under this
Act may, either before or after the institution of the prosecution, on an application by
the alleged offender, be compounded by payment of compounding amount not more
than fifty thousand by such officer or authority as the appropriate Government may, by
notification in the Official Gazette, specify in this behalf:

Provided that the appropriate Government may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, amend the said specified compounding amount:

Provided further that the offences of the same nature committed by the same
offender for more than three occasions shall not be compoundable:

Provided also that such offences shall be compounded only after the alleged
offender has acted to the satisfaction of such officer or authority that such offence is not
continued any further:

(2)  Where an offence has been compounded under sub-section (1), no further
proceedings shall be taken against the offender in respect of such offence in respect of
such offence and the offender, if in custody, shall be released or discharged.”.

skok skoskok ko

10. THE STREET VENDORS (PROTECTION OF LIVELIHOOD AND REGULATION OF

Section 1.-

Section 2.-

STREET VENDING) ACT, 2014
(7 of 2014)

In sub-section (2), omit “except the State of Jammu and Kashmir”.

In sub-section (1), in clause (a), in sub-clause (ii), after “the Government of the National
Capital Territory of Delhi”, insert “the Government of the Union territory of Jammu and
Kashmir”.

shskeoskoskoskokosk

11. THE TRADE UNIONS ACT, 1926
(16 of 1926)

Substitution of section 9- For section 9, substitute —

Certificate
registration.

of

“9.The Registrar, on registering a Trade Union under section 8, shall issue a
certificate of registration within a period not exceeding thirty days subject to
the fulfillment of other provisions of this Act in the prescribed form which
shall be conclusive evidence that the Trade Union has been duly registered
under this Act”.

skosk skoskok koo

[F. No. 11012/16/2020-SRA]
AJAY KUMAR BHALLA, Home Secy.



