The Arunachal Pradesh Gazette

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 259, Vol. XXVI, Naharlagun, Tuesday, June 25, 2019, Asadha 4, 1941

(Saka)

GOVERNMENT OF ARUNACHAL PRADESH
DEPARTMENT OF PANCHAYATI RAJ
ITANAGAR

NOTIFICATION
The 2nd June, 2019

THE ARUNACHAL PRADESH PANCHAYATS (CONDUCT OF ELECTION)
(AMENDMENT) RULES, 2018

No. PR-159/2018.—In exercise of the power conferred by Section 150 of the Arunachal Pradesh Panchayati
RajAct, 1997, (Act No. 5 of 2001) the Governor of Arunachal Pradesh is pleased to make the following rules to
amend the Arunachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj (Conduct of Election) Rules, 2001, except as respect things
done or omitted to be done before such amendment, for regulating the Conduct of Election of Gram Panchayat

and Zilla Parishad and all other matter relating thereto under the said Act, namely:-
1. (1) These rules may be called the Arunachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj (Conduct of
Election) (Amendment) Rules, 2018.
(2) They shall come into force at once.

2. (1) IntheArunachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj (Conduct of Election) Rules, 2001. (herein
after referred to as the Principal Rules), in sub-rule (1) of Rule 2, in clause (e), the
words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words "Gram Panchayat" and before the
word "or" shall be deleted.

(2) insub-rule (1) of Rule 2, in clause (f) the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the
words "Gram Panchayat" and before the word "and" shall be deleted.

(3) insub-rule (1) of Rule 2, in clause (g), in sub-clause (iii), the words "Anchal Samiti"
appearing after the words "Gram Panchayat" and before the word "and" shall be
deleted.

(4) insub-rule (1) of Rule 2, in clause (j) the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the
words "Gram Panchayat" and before the word "and" shall be deleted.

3. Inthe Principal Rule, sub-rule (2) of Rule 5 shall be deleted.

4. Inthe Principal Rule, the word sub-rule (3) the following shall be substituted:;-

"(3) Every nomination paper presented to the Returning Officer shall be in Form 2(A) in
case of Gram Panchayat and in Form 2 (C) in case of Zilla Parishad.

Provided that a failure to complete or defects in completing the declaration as to
the symbol in a nomination paper in Form 2 (A) or 2 (C) shall not be deemed to be a
defect of substantial character within the meaning of sub-rule (4) of rule 12".

5. (1) Inthe Principal Rule, sub-rule (2) of Rule 9 shall be deleted.
(2) Insub-rule (4) of Rule 9, the words, "or Table-B" shall be deleted.

6. (1) Inthe Principal Rule, in clause (a) of Rule 10, for the word and figures "Rs.50" the
word and figures "Rs. 500" shall be substituted.

(2 Clause (b) of Rule 10 shall be deleted.

(3) In clause (c) of Rule 10, for the word and figures "Rs. 200" the word and figures
"Rs. 2000" shall be substituted.

Shorttitle
and commen-
cement.

Amendment
of Rule 2.

Amendment
of Rule 5.

Amendment
of Rule 5.

Amendment
of Rule 9.

Amendment
of Rule 10.



2 The Arunachal Pradesh Extraordinary Gazette, June 25, 2019

7. In Rule 22 of the Principal Rule, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the word Amendment
"Panchayat" and before the word "or" shall be deleted. of Rule 22.

8. In the Principal Rule, the Heading of part-lll shall be substituted as below:- Amendment

f Heading of
"POLL AND VOTING IN GRAM PANCHAYATS AND ZILLA PARISHAD CONSTITUENCIES" gart—lll. 9

9. InRule 25 of the Principal Rule, the words "in Form 15(A) for Anchal Samiti" appear after  Amendment
the words "Gram Panchayat" and before the word "and" shall be deleted. of Rule 25.

10. (1) Inclause (b) of Rule 48 of the Principal Rule, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing Amendment
after the words "Gram Panchayat" and before the word "or" shall be deleted. of Rule 48.

(2) Inclause (e) of Rule 48 of the Principal Rule, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing
after the words "Gram Panchayat" and before the word "or" shall be deleted.

1. In sub-rule (3) of Rule 53 of the Principal Rule, the words "Anchal Samiti Election” Amendment
appearing after the word "Election" and before the word "or" shall be deleted. of Rule 53.

12. (1) Insub-rule (2) of Rule 56 of the Principal Rule, for the words "Anchal Samiti or" Amendment
appearing after the word "to" and before the words "Zilla Parishad" the words, "Gram of Rule 56.
Panchayat" shall be substituted..

(2)  In sub-rule (3) of Rule 56 of the Principal Rule, the words "Anchal Samiti Election"
appearing after the word "Election" and before the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be
deleted.

(3) Insub-Rule (4) of Rule 56 of the Principal Rule, the words "Anchal Samiti election"
appearing after the words "Gram Panchayat Election" and before the words "Zilla
Parishad" shall be deleted.

13. (1) Insub-Rule (2) of Rule 60 of the Principal Rule, for the words "Anchal Samiti or" Amendment
appearing after the word "to" and before the words "Zilla Parishad”, the words "Gram  of Rule 60.
Panchayat" shall be substituted.

(2) Insub-Rule (4) of Rule 60 of the Principal Rule, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing
after the words "Gram Panchayat" and before the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be
deleted.

14. InRule 63 of the Principal Rule, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing in the headingand  Amendment
after the words "Gram Panchayat" and before the word "or" shall be deleted. of Rule 63.

15. Inthe Principal Rule, the Heading of Part-IV shall be substituted as below:- Amendment

ing of

"ELECTION OF CHAIRPERSON OF GRAM PANCHAYAT OR ZILLA PARISHAD" ,?,;"r'tjf,d'"g :

16. (1) InRule 67 of the Principal Rule, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing in the heading  Amendment
and whenever appears shall be deleted. of Rule 67.

(2) Insub-Rule (2) of Rule 67 of the Principal Rule, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing
after the words "Gram Panchayat" and before the word "or" shall be deleted.

17.  Inthe Principal Rule, Schedule-I| Table-B, shall be deleted. Delection of

Table-B.

18. In the Principal Rule, in the "Notice of Election" appearing below Table-C under Amendment
Schedule-lll, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words "Gram Panchayats"  of Notice of
and before the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. Election.

19. In the Principal Rule, "Perforation" appearing after Form-2(A), for the words "Anchal Amendment
Samiti" shall be substituted by the words "Gram Panchayat". of Perforation.

20. Inthe Principal Rule, Form-2(B), shall be deleted. Delection of

Form-2(B).

21. Inthe Principal Rule, "Perforation” appearing after Form-2(B), shall be deleted. Delection of

Perforation.

22. In the Principal Rule, in Form-3, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-3.

23. In the Principal Rule, in Form-4, the words “Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-4.

24. In the Principal Rule, in Form-5, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-5.

25. In the Principal Rule, in Form-8, the words "Anchal Samitj" appearing after the words Amendment

“Gram Panchayat" and after the words “Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted.

of Form-6.



The Arunachal Pradesh Extraordinary Gazette, June 25, 2019 3
26. In the Principal Rule, in Form-7, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words  Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-7.
27. In the Principal Rule, in Form-8, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words ~Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-8.
28. In the Principal Rule, in Form-9, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words ~Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-9.
29. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-10, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words ~ Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-10.
30. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-11, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words ~ Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-11.
31. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-12, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words  Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-12.
32. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-13, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words ~ Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-13.
33. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-14, the words "Anchal Samiti" wherever appears shallbe  Amendment
deleted. of Form-14.
34. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-15(A), shall be deleted. Deletion of
Form-15(A).
35. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-16, the words "Anchal Samiti" wherever appears shallbe Amendment
deleted. of Form-16.
36. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-17, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words  Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-17.
37. InthePrincipal Rule, in Form-18, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words ~ Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-18.
38. In the Principal Rule, in Form-18(A), the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the ~Amendment
words "Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Fom-18(A).
39. In the Principal Rule, in Form-19, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words ~ Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-19.
40. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-20, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words ~ Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-20.
41. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-21, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words  Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-21.
42. In the Principal Rule, in Form-21(A), the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the Amendment
words "Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-21(A).
43. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-22, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words ~ Amendment
"Gram Panchayat"' and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-22.
44. In the Principal Rule, in Form-23, the words "Anchal Samiti" appearing after the words  Amendment
"Gram Panchayat" and after the words "Zilla Parishad" shall be deleted. of Form-23.
45. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-24, the words "Anchal Samiti" wherever appears shallbe  Amendment
deleted. of Form-24.
46. Inthe Principal Rule, in Form-25, the words "Anchal Samiti" wherever appears shallbe  Amendment
deleted. of Form-25.
Rinchin Tashi, IAS
Secretary (PR),
Government of Arunachal Pradesh.
Itanagar

Published and Printed by Directorate of Printing, Naharlagun.-575/2019-DoP-250+Secy.(Panchayati Raj)-50-6-2019.



