
" 8CT"t lfPI c;, ~I lt-1---1 

P1rn cf~ ~)u1-11 ~ 
1-t~le>tll 

Gl\J <t> crl1 IO I fti~ 1fcFf. '<Ill 9,'< 

~"iAT 
'1'. I ll 9,'( ~ .--J j ch 2 9 - '3 - '2... ~ C 3 

~ ~ - 10/ 1r /2003/~/qr'q/(l'-) - ~ fcmxl cITT" ~. 1955 (~ 

74 ~ 1956) c#'r tITTT 8 (5) ~ ~ ~lf4ti~'i cITT ~ -q C1ffi ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ 
P!f..-1faftia ~ ~ t -

~fflq;:J 
1. m cft 7% ~w -q q51c11c1tEt ~ ~ ~ "2003" cf ~~ 1:R 3Tcf, "2004" 

~~~~ :-
3l.w. 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 
6. 

7. 

8. 

9. 

10. 

11. 

12. 

13. 

14. 

~~ 
~-3-28--2000-m-tjt-q (38) 

1973 /~ / 10- 372 / 2001 /~--qf=q (51) 

~-10 / 385 / 2001 /~ ;-qrq (60) 

~-10/391 /2001 /qfcp /-qfq (65) 

~-10/392/2001 /qfcp /-qfq (71) 

~-10-16/2002/q[cp/tj'r-q (16) 
~-10-29/2002/~ /tj'r-q (38) 
~ - 10 / 43 / 2002 / cflq) Jtjm (54) 

~-10-48/2002/~ /tjm (60) 

~-10 / 15 /2002/q[cp /tj'f=q (82) 

~/10-15/2002/qfcp/~ (83) 

~-10-67 /2002/q[cp /tj'r-q (84) 

~-10- 72 /2002/cflqj /tj'r-q (91) 

~-10- 95/2002/q[cp/tj'r-q (117) 

R_-,jcf, 

17.04.2000 

10.09.2001 

29.10.2001 

09.11.2001 

12.11.2001 

12.02.2002 

27.03.2002 
02.05.2002 

21.05.2002 

16.07.2002 

17.07.2002 

23.07.2002 

07.08.2002 

28.12.2002 

8icfilft~lq, cf) '<!\v-llYlci cf) ~ ~ crm 3-ll~~lljxil'< 

~ ?~ ~--~\ - . 

(ct.3TR.f4m) 
'11l~ 

~ ~ ?_C/-0'3 -2.C 03 

~ ~-10 / (£', / 2003/qfcp/ qi'q/ f r-'lffi<i cfi ~cf>~ 348 cfi ~ (3) cf> 
3-l jfl x0 1 ll, ~ fc)1wr ctr~~ ~ - 10/ tB" / 2003 / cflqj/ qi"=q/(t~) ~2 3-03 

iti'"r ~ ~ '<\\.T.q q1c1 cfi ~ xl ~ ~ \.l cf,\~lci ~ \ifTfil i I 



- Government of Chhatti garb 
Finance and Planning Dep~rtment 

Mantralaya I 
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhavan, RAIPUR 

I 
NOTIFICATION 

ai pur, Dated 2 9 - 03 ,.2._e-, c '3 

No.F-10/ '25' /2003/CTN( J f.) - In exercise of rowers conferred by section 8 (5) of 
Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956) the state gove ment hereby makes the following 
amendments:-

AMENDMENTS 

1. In the notifications given below for the figure related o period "2003" the figure "2004" 
shall be substituted: -

S.No. 
l. 
2. 
3. 
4. 
5. 
6. 
7. 
8. 
9. 
10. 
11. 
12. 
13 . 
14. 

Notification No. 
1685-F-10i332/2001/CTN (38) 
1973/F/10-372/2001/CT-V (51) 
F-10/385/2001/CTN (60) 
F-10/391/2001/CTN (65) 
F-10/392/2001/CTN (71) 
F-10-16/2002/CTN (16) 
F-10-29/2002/CTN (38) 
F-10/43/2002/CTN (54) 
F-10/48/2002/CTN (60) 
F-10/15/2002/CTN (82) 
F/10-15/2002/CTN (83) 
F-10-67/2002/CTN (84) 
F-10-72/2002/CTN (91) 
F-10-95/2002/CT/V (117) 

Date 
10.08.2001 
10.09.2001 
29.10.2001 
09.11.2001 
12.11.2001 
12.02.2002 
27.03.2002 
02.05.2002 
21.05 .2002 
16.07.2002 
17.07.2002 
23.07.2002 
07 .08 .2002 
28.12.2002 

By order and in the naJ e of the Governor of Chhattisgarh, 

~~~ 
(K.R. Misra) 

Deputy Secretary 



\J~fPl d. ~l lfF1 

fcrru (f~ ll) \JF11 ~'J-t Pl 
Tf~l &i ll 

~ cf> e-l:11°1 ft:i~ ~ . xlll9,-< 

¢mi-=q;rr 

~. ITTTcfi tl tt~~oo'3 

~ ~ - 10 / .2.0 / 2003 / qfq')/~ ("2.'L) - ;~~lv-ll ~ ~ % ~ 
ITT Tf<TT 6 fcn ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ 311 <Hl1c.b t ~ ' ~ GR ~ 1956 

(~ 74 ~ 1956) c#r mxT 8 c#r ~ (5) &RT ~ ~IU@lil cpl" ~ ~ "BIB ~ 
~ xNc.blx ~ ~ . cl1cHWit ~ ~ (4) c#r 3Wlffi3TT ~ ~ ~ "l:R, m cfT ~ 
~ cfj ~ (2) ~ fc1f.'lfc!~ 1,@ cfj qrf q)T ~ (3) 4 Fc1P1Fc!~ xWTT (lq), \)(@ 

~ cfi ~ (4) ~ Fcif.-1 Pc!~ frrt-.£FTT c=rm ~ cfi 31"~ 1 ~. 2003 "ff 31 TffcT, 
2004 c,cp ctt c.bl&ilclrcl cfi ~ GR cfi ~ °ff ~ >fcfFl 7 S :-

3T ~ ~ ~ 

31" . (p l ~3TT qfr 
I 

Be' qfr xWTT I frr.JHUT @ii ftR<j; I 
I 

c,, 

_g)ufr , ~ @~~~ctr 
I ~t 

( 1) (2) (3) (4) 
1. fu:iR ~· i 3fflcl: ~ ~ ~ cR ctt --

~ ~ 1 qfci1;11c, 'ITT ~ I I 
2. ~ ~ Jk@: ~ !lc.bTx ~ cR "$1 -

~~~ ~ tTccR 1 qfci1;11c, ir ~ I I 
I cfi~4iMi ! ~: ~ ~ ~ ~ c#r 

(", 

~ ~{?_fff I ~ 8irnlfl JI~ ~ 
i ~ tTccR 2 qf?l1;11c, 67' ~ I I w:r 3fl ~1 Fri c.b ~ GRT I 

I l \i 0TTl G ~ ~ ~ tr I 

(", ...;,.. ' ' ~ 8i rn I fi-1 ct, Cfl x I \J'<-1 q I c-1 cp ~ xi e1m 01rr-=I <h-n~ 1~1 j~x-1~1 ( 

~ ,,-.---- \-1~ 
(q;_311x_ ~m) 

xfq tf~q 
~. ~ l-lf-~oo'3 

~- ~ - 10/.Q'o / 2003 / qfq') / ~-1ITTC7 cfi ~ cfi ~ 348 cfi ~ 
(3) cfi 01jflxDI ~ . ~ TTP:rPT ctt ~ ~ ~-10 / !:26/ 2003 / cffcp / l:Trq ('2.'2..), 
~ {~4~ 0 2. cBT ~ ~ xl\J'<-1%:'1 cfi ~ ~. ~ ITTxT q¢1~1c, fcn<TT \i,TcTT 5 1 

8irn°mi1ct; ~ x1\J'.qq1&1 ct ~ it c=rm 311~~11jxilx, 

~~- ----(__~ ) 

(~_311x_ ~m 
tjlf fi~q 



I 

attisgar 1 
I 

Go ernment of C 
Finance and Planni 

antral 
Dau Kal an Sin0 h B f

!Department 

R
I. 

wan, a.i1pur 
I 
I 

NOTIFICATION 

Raipur, Dated 

No. F-10/ .:2.0 /2003 /CT/V( '242.) - Whereas, the State Government is satisfied that 
it is necessary so to do in public interest: 

Now, therefore. in exercise of powers conferred by s~1b section (5) of Section 8 of 
the Central Sales Act. 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State p ovemment hereby, on the 
fu lfill ment of the requ irements laid down in subsection 4). exempts the class of goods 
pecifi d in co lumn (2 ) r the chedul be low from paymen of tax under the said Act. to 

th xt nr specified in col umn ~) f, r the period from 1st Ap ii, 2003 to 31st March, 2004 
ubje t t th re tri ti n_ um.l c nd ition specified in column (4) of the said Schedule, -

S. No. 

(1) 
1. 

2. 

., 
_). 

SCHEDULE 

Class of goods I Extent of Restrttions and condition s 
I Exemption subje ,t to which exemption is 

I 
granterd 

(2) (3) (4) 
Readymade garments Partly so as to 

I 
-

reduce the rate 
, of tax to 1% 

1 Jute cloth and jute twine Partly so as to -
reduce the rate 
of tax to 1 % 

Chemicals Partly so as to When manufactured and sold b,· 
I reduce the rate small scale industries situated in 

of tax to 2% Chhaij isgarh State. 

By order and in the name oft e Governor of Chhatti sgarh. 

(K.R.Misra) 
Deputy secretary 

I 
I 



/ 

\:P ml ftJ I <t. ~ II fH 

fcfrn am ~) \ii-11 fcJRrTT 
ll-511 c'1 l1 

G@> ¢C"l1IOI ~ ~ . xll19,'< 

~.~ o~ - 05'-2-0d8 

~ ~-1013s-120031cffq)11Tfq" (4p) - ¥ ~ Wffi cm- <ffi ~ m lfm i 
~ "fficp fITTl -4 ~ cpffi 3TT~ t ~ ~ ~ r ~ 1955 (cplTTcp 74 x=Ff 1955) 

cBt ~ a cBt ~ (5) ~ ~ ~lfcrali'i <ITT ~ -4 ~ ~ ~ -.!Nc~·iix ~ m . cllc1f11l11 

~ ~ (4) clft 3lG"aTT3TT clft ~ ffl lR, ~ <ft ~ ~ ct ~ (2) -4 RlPIFcfte .:rrc,r ct 
qrf cm- m (3) -ir fclPIFcfte -~ o<P, \iCfo ~ ct ~ (4) -ir Rlf.tfcfte ~ a~ ~ <fi 
~ m 11 \.l¢1~1-i ~ ~ 31 llf'<l, 2004 cfcp cCtj ¢lcilcl~ cf>~ 'PX cfi :r@R ~ ~ 
>fGR~t :-

31. ~JTT~ ~qft~ ~ cf2TT ™ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ 
'P. ~ ~ qft ~ t 
( 1) (2) (3) (4) 
1. S::1~4Jl4x 3lmf: ~~~q)Xqft '1fij 8 C\"flf1Ji<ti ~ l) ~ ~tllfrlcp ~ 

~ ~ 1 \.l~~i\l "ITT ~ I &RT '3 94 1 ~ fl ~ fcrfincf "ITT I 

~ . ~ 0 3 ~ ()5'~ 2-00'3 

~- ~-10/'3? /2003/qlq)/1Tfq-~ cf> ~ cf> ~ 348 cf> ~ (3) cf> 
3lj-tN°1 ll, ~ ~ qft ~ cpllfi'p ~10/3~/2003 /c.IT<l>/"Qf'r.l (45'), ~9-5~c'.>3cpl 
~ 3f¥TG xl""ll4IC'1 cfi ~ ~. ~ ~ \.lcf>l~ld f<n<:IT u-lTdT i I 

tPCTflfiJ\ct, ~ 'l!I \J"ll4lc1 cf> "-iTl, ~ c'f2TT 0-Jl~~lljfilx, 

I ~J. 
("$.3ITT. ~-m) 
~~ 



Government of Chhattisgarh 
Finance and Planning IDepartment 

Mantralaya 
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan Raipur 

NOTIFICATIG 

Raipur, Dated ob~ 05 ~ 2-00'3 

No. F-10136 /2003/CTN(4 5 ) - Whereas, tlhe State Government is satisfied that it is 
necessary so to do in public interest; I 

Now, therefore, in exercise of powers conferred by sub section (5) of Section 8 of the 
Central Sales Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State Go ernment hereby, on the fulfillment of the 
requirements laid down in subsection (4), exempts the cl ss of goods specified in column (2) of the 
Schedule below from payment of tax under the said Act. to the extent specified in column (3) for 
the period from the date of publication in official gazt)!tte to 31st March, 2004 subject to the 
restrictions and conditions specified in column (4) of the said Schedule, -

s. Class of 
No. goods 

(1) (2) 
I. Transformer 

SCHEDULE 

Extent of Exemption Restrictions and conditions subject to which 
exempt~on is granted 

(3) (4) 
Partly so as to reduce the When ~anufactured and sold by an industrial 
rate of tax to 1 percent unit situated in Chhanisgarh State. 

By order and in the name of the Governor ofChhattisgarh, 

(K.R. Misra) 
Deputy secretary 



1 

-, 
oct\'ttF"t<t, ~lltFi 

~ elm 4'\Jl~I ~ 
(qlful~cb "cbx ~) 

'1-541<:1~ 
~ q;twqlOI fm" 1lcFf, '(!~~ 

3T~~"ifl 

~. ~o-G,-.2..c,b2 ~-<,~lf g~-<. ~ 1 1 cf> ..;> ::;:::> 

• 

ct5~ict> ~ - 10/ SI /2003/cflq)/qfq {.63) - ~ ~ ~ cm ~ 
~ 6T Tfm ~ f<r>- ~ f6o Ti ~ ~ 3llcl~-acf> t ~ ~~')~ fctclRl cfR 

~ 1956 (cpJijcp 74 ~ 1956) ~ tTRT 8 ~ ~ (s) IDxT ~ ~lfcl-a~) cl>T 
~ it c'fIB W ~ fi-<cf>I-< ~&Rf ~ w&iicf, ~-10/29/2002/qJcp/ 

LfT"iT (38) ~-1icf, 21.03.2002 it Plklljfil-< ~ ~ ~ :-

~~h~ 

2. ~ "ffiTI1eR 01.07.2003 ~ ~~lcl~cl ITT1TT I 

~ 
(c6°.3TR. flt-m) 
\N~ 

i~ 3o-(;-2.$ "3 
~. G'll41 

cplITq>_ ~-10/St /2003/cJTcf>/1lm-1ffict cfi ~ cfi 3lji-0G 348 cfi ~ 
(3) cfi 3ljfh!0I ~. ~ fcrwT cfiT ~ cplITq) ~-10/~/ /2003/qlq)/lffil (b3j. 
ITTfcn .50-(r-2ci0_,3 cf)T ~ ~ -<I\J"ll41c.1 cfi mfw5R ~. ~ G"RT Ucf51~1c'l fcpm ~ 
t1 

\ 



Government of Chhattisgarh 
Finance and Planning Department 

(Commercial Tax D partment) 
Mantralaya 

Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur 

NOTIFICA TIO 
t(' 

Raipur, Dated ~o- (;-_ ~~~3 ·. ; .' 
t:11' ' .... 

No. F-10/ SI /2003/CTN( 63. ) - Whereas, the State Government is 
satisfied that it is necessary so to do in public interest 

Now, therefore, in exercise of powers conferred by sub section (5) of 
Section 8 of the Central Sales Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State Government 
hereby makes the following amendment in the nqtification No. F-10/29/2002/CTN 
(38) dated 27-03-2002 :-

AMENDMENT 

1. In the Schedule of the notification entry related to S.No. 5 shall be omitted. 

2. This amendment shall come into force with effect from 01.07.2003. 

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh, 

~AM~ 
.---J 

(K.R. Misra) 
Deputy secretary 



.. 8ro1f1 41~1

i ~llfl'1 

~ ~ ~FIT ~'Jil4l 
(q1fcl1f¾cv ct>x ~111~1) 
~ 

Gra> q;~101 ~ 1l<Ff, xi~~ 

wS-licfj ~-10/62/2003/cTicn/trrq (-fg" ) - cfi"11°1ll fcmR:r ~ ~. 1956 
(-C,--wTTT'ii-,-cfj 74 ~ 1956), ~ ~ 8 ~ ~ (5) &ffi ~ ~1fc@~1• cpT ~ ~ wit ~ 
~ fixcfjlx ~ mxT ~ fcnwr c5l" ~ wi-Jicfj ~-10/392/2001 / qfq) / -qf-"il" 
(11), R1icfj 12.11.2001. ir f.:ls:..=i,j{lh' mITtR ~ ~-?:Tm. -

~ ~ cBi 3ijxi-q
0

1 if, -3:j>iSl--ficb 1 cf)" ~ cbl&ll--f (4)(~) ir 3Tcn ~ ~T~ "2 

\.lffi~lci'' cf)" x~ ~ ~ ~ ~ " 1 ~IB™" ~~ fcp-m ~. ~ 

2. Jljwl--ficfj 2 cfJ" ~ cbl&ll--f (3) ~ 3lcP ~ ~ "2 \.lffi!tlcl' cfi x~ ~ 3Tcn ~ ~ 
"1 \.lffi~lci" mm~ fcnm ~ I 

9rolx-1 1ld ct x1\J".1.1q1&-1 ct ~ ~ er~ 3ll~~llj~-1h:, 

~~) 

(~.am. iTfm) 
\1'Cl~ 

x1£Jgx. R4Tc1, :V... /08/2003 

'P~ICf>. ~-10 / 62 / 2003 / qfcp / 1:fr-cT-~ cfi ~ cfi JljiUG 348 cfi ~ (3) ~ 
J.ljfJ-.!OJ ir, ~ fcrTT.T cB1" ~ cpl-jjcfj ~-10 / 62 / 2003 / cfT<fj / -q-fq (78' ), 
R.--Jicf>.2') .... / os / 2003 "cf>"T ~ ~ x1\J";qq 1a ct ~ ~-~ &RT 1,1cfj1~ia ~ 
\JlTill t I 

) 



Government of ~hhaHisgarh 
Finance and Plann~ng Department 

(Commercial Ta~ Depf rtment) 
Mantra~aya 

Dau Kalyan Singh fbawan, Raipur 

NOTIFICATION 

Raipur, Dated Q.~ /08/2003 

No. F-10/62/2003/CTN ( 7 ~ ) - In exercise of powers conferred by sub-section 
(5) of section 8 of the Central Sales Tax t 11956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State 
Government hereby makes the following amendments\ in this department Notification No. 
F-10/392/2001 /CTN (71 ), dated 12.11.2001, n~mely, -

AMENDIVIEN1l 
I 

In the Schedule to the said notification, in colunr. ( 4 )(b) against serial No. 1 for the 
figure "2%" the figure and word "1 percent" sh~ll be spbstituted, and 

2. In column (3) against serial No. 2 for the figure "2%" the figure and word "1 
percent" shall be substituted. 

These amendments shall come into forcct from the date of publication in official 
gazette. 

By order and in the na m of the Governor of Chhattisgarh. 

-
I ~~ 

(K.R.Misra) 
Deputy secretary 



8ctl1ti JI ct, ~ II Xi 1 
fcmr ~ ~'10111 ' ~ 
(qlfi11~ch ~ 1~) 

'--1'31 lcri ll 
G@) qjC"lllol ~ 1f"<R, -<Ill~'< 

. ~~11 

~ . R 'i i qi t !J-;,Ja '-J 2c, C 3 

~ ~-10 / t/1 / 2003 / qlcfi / ~ ( 83->) ,-- ~ ~ mx-R qjT ~ ~ -gT ,rm 
E fcn" illqJ ~ "B ~ ~ Jllcl~llcfi E ~ <h~i ll ~ cf>x ~, 1956 (~ 74 ~ 
1956) ~ ~ s ~ ~ (5) &RT ~ ~,Fckill7 ~ ~ # e>TIB ~ ~ fl's(¢1's( ~ ~ 
~ ~ ~-10 / 49/2003/qjqJ / 1TT"'cf (60) R ri i cfi 23.06.2003 "B PIYljfll's( ~ ~ 
E :-

'3cKf ~ cm JJj'!fc-1"1 # JJjwJ-Ji¢ (1) rt ~ ~ (4) li RlPl~tc ~~ c=rm wa' 
fcl&11fqa cm ~ ~ I 

2. ~ ~ 01 .09.2003 ~ "\:f~lcl~fl&l ITT1TT I 

-~ J--
(~ .3ITT. ftr.l?>TT) 
~~ 

~' ITTTcfi t £ ;:J.-J-iq '-._ r2 d C _3 

~ r:;q=i- 10/LtCf / 2003 /qlcfi / 1ITTf- 1'.fmf ~ ~ rt ~j~C: 348 c5 ~ (3) c5 Jljfl>iUI 
'If, ~ fcrWT cm ~ ~ ~-10 / ti't / 2003/ q1cp/tfrif ( <zf,3). R-'11¢ t-9-uro~cITT 
~ ~ 's(l 1J"-1Q 1c1 cB" ~ -it, ~ &RT \.lcf51~1c-r ~ ufIB E 1 



Government of Chhattisgarh 
Finance and Planning Dep:::J ment 

(Commercial Tax Depart .. 
1
ent) 

Mantralaya 
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur 

NOTIFICATION I 

Raipur, Dated 1 ~ - -:zcc3, 

No. F-l 01 lt? I 2003/CTN ( 8-'.7) - Whereas, tHe Stat Government is satisfied that it is 
necessary so to do in public interest; 

I 

Now, therefore, in exercise of powers conferr d by 1ub-section 5 of Section 8 of the 
Central Sales Tax Act, 1956, (No. 74 of 1956), th 1 State Government hereby makes the 
following amendment in the notification No. F-10/49/2 03/CT (60) dated 23.06.2003: -

AMENDMENT 

In the schedule to the said notification, restricti o1~s and l,:Onditions specified in column ( 4) 
against serial No. ( l) shall be omitted. 

2. This amendment shall come into force with effec t from 1.09.2003. 

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh, 

(K.R. Misra) 
Deputy Secretary 



-

-

. .,. 
.:,,/· 

-

I") 

9m iii'lj ~llii1 
~ ~ ~ Fct111 •1 
(ctl~l~cb cfix ~'iil'I) 

lf.iITRlf 

G@;" cf>~101 ftrn- 1fcA, xi~~-< 

. , ·· .· ~-~ )b~~1 --z_oCl3=, 

~ -1{1lr-·10/ 6'~ /2003/cffifi /1TTil ( ~3) - ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ 
WTTclR m 1Tm 6 Fl> ~ fITT=f 1l ~ ~ 3ll<H~cb 6-~ ~~~ ~ cITT' ~ 
1956 (~ 74 "fir( · 1956) cJfr tfRT 8 cffr ~tfRT (s) &RT~ ~1Fctam cfJT "Q<.Wr 1l C1@ ~ 
~ fF!qjlx ~ &NT, d1clfll~ &RT ~ (4) cnl' 3f!raTT3TT cnl' ~ ffl 1R, -;fm cfr ~ 
3lj~-6t cf> ~ (2) -q Fclf1Fc!~ ~ cf> ~ cf>T ~ (3) 1l f4f1~~ ~ cfcl>, '3cff1 

3lj~-4) cf> ~ (4) 1l fqf-1~~ ~ TI2f ~ cf> 3l~ '<1'114~ 1l Qcbl~H ~ ~ 
31.03.2004 clq; cJfr cblc--llqffl cf> ~ cITT' cf> ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ t,-

3l. ~3TT 
w. cpl W1fi 
·(1J'" r-a--(2) 

1. ~ 
'ill<l 

3J ;i ~ 

~ cpl "$TT ~ cl~ Wff ~ 3l~ ~ 
~- ,, ~ t(c ~ cpl" TTt t 

(3) (4) 
~: ~~~mxT8 ~ 4\J'l"lcfi_c'l c.Qclfll{ ~ ~ 1l fum 
cf>! ~ (1) cf) ~ cITT' cf>! ~~~m~~~ll 
Gx" l:-1ccf>x 1 Qffi~1a m ~ I tj \Jll~d m &NT Qfifct>..(01 / i0{~ll 

,. 4~illci ~ ~I 
' 

\:.9rolfF~ cfi -<IIJ'll4Icl cfi ~ ~ m.rr ~,~~lljfll'<, 

~v,~~ 
{qi.3JR. fff-m) 
~~ 

x~. f4siicp l6~d irf~2.d~ 

~ ~-10/6'3 /2003/cfTcf>/qrq~~ cf>~ cf> 3lji'UG 348 cfi ~ (3) 

cf> ~jf!xuI ll, ~ ~ cnl' ~ ~ ~-10/B~ /2003/q'l""cp/-qtq (8_9 ). 
~ tf,/r,/o? cf5T ~ 3T:!cfTG -<I~41C'l ~ , ~ ~. ~ &ffi Q<hl~la f$m ~ t I 

t§ro"lfPI<? cf> -<IIJ'll4IC'l cfi -;,r, ~ m.IT 3ll~~lljfll-<, 

~ ➔ 



... 

--- - - - - Ge-v~-Gi'-{;Jat-tisgafh 
Finance and Planning Department 

(Commercial Tax D partment) 
Mantralaya 

Dau Kalyan Singh Bhf wan, Raipur 

NOTIFICAT~ON 

Raipur,Dated )/6 SE!pf- 2o~ 

No. F-1O/ 6'812003/CTN( Sj )- Whereas, the State Government is satisfied 
that it is necessary so to do in public interest; 

Now, therefore, in exercise of powers co~ferred by sub section (5) of Section 
8 of the Central Sales Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State Government hereby, on 
the fulfillment of the requirements laid down in !subsection ( 4 ), exempts the class of 
goods specified in column (2) of the Schedule br low from payment of tax under the 

s~id ~c!, to the ~:'_t~?~?ecified i~ c~lumn ~4~ for_~he_y~od fro~ - the -~~te _ ~f-
-~~r--c==-----nubfica-tfun- 111---offi-e1-a-l -g-azet-te to 3-l .O3-:---200:\-=---Stt ~eet -e -A~-ffi"=ns- aRa=--

conditions specified in column (4) of the said Sc i edule,-

S. Class of 
No. oods 

1 2 
1. Packet 

Tea 

SCHEDULE 

Extent of Exemption - Restrf tions -and conditions -subject to 
whicli exem tion is anted 

3 4 
Partly so as to reduce Whe sold by a registered dealer after 
the rate of tax under processing/ blending who is a small-
sub-section (I) of scale unit situated in the state and 
Section 8 to 1 ercent re ist(i!red in industries de artment. 

By order ai:1d in the n,e of the Governor ofChhattisgarh, 

' /, . 

~ /\AJ~_:::-­

(K.R. Misra) 
Deputy secretary 



g@) fl' Id ~lTfFf 

~ om .Ql\jf-11 fct+rT7T 
~,fil,~q, qjx ~) 

S-!~le1~ 
~ cf>~IOI ~ ~. -<l~g-< 

~™'11 

~ . ITTTcf> b - I o - 2....0 o .3 

~ ~ - 10 / 7 c / 2003/cfTcn /t:ffil ( 9'~) - ~ ~ ~ qi1 ~ ~ if 
TJ<TT ~ ~ c11qJ ~ -q tflT cf>BT ~lc:J~lli'fJ t ~ ~ ~ "cfJx ~ 1956 (~ 74 ~ 
1956) ctfl" mxr s cp'1" ~ (s) ~ ~ ~,fcffizi'i cm- ~ it ~ siz ~ "fRcnR ~ mxr 
~ w=rfcp ~-10 / 29 / 2002/cffcp_/l:"JTcf (119) ~ 31 .12.2002 it Ri•-•-tljfllx ~ 
~i :-

'3cRf ~ B ~ "xl(jjq-;';l cf ~i'fJl~H ~ n" cf x~ 'Qx 3Ti'fJT ~ ~ "01.04.2002 

n··~~rctmvrn:;1 

~ ITTTT-Fi b - Io- 2-oOp 

~ ~-10/ 7c; 2003 / qTcp / Gnl- 1IT«f ~ ~ "if5 ~ 348 cf~ (3) ~ Jijfl-< 01 B. 
~ fcMrT ct,-~ ~ ~-10 / 7 o / 2003 / cfTcn / t:ffil (9S..-). ~b-lo-2..oq3 "i'fJl 

~ ~ xl"ll4IC'1 cf ~ it ~ &RT Qcpl~la fctm vITTlT ~ I 



Government of Chhattisgarh 
Finance and Planningi Department 

(Commercial Tax D partment) 
Mantralaya 

Dau Kalyan Singh Bh~wan, Raipur 

TIFICATI.O 

Raipur, Dat d {;, - lo - 2-oo_.3 

No. F-10/ 7 o /2003/CTN ( 9 S- ) - Whereas, the State Government is 
satis~ ed that it is necessary so to do in public int , rest; 

· Now, therefore, in exercise of powers conD rred by sub-section (5) of Section 8 
of Cep.tral Sales Tax Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State Government hereby makes 
the fqllowing amendment in the Notification . F/10-29/2002/CTN (119), dated 
31-12-2002:-

In the said notification for the words "from the date of publication in gazette" 
the wQrds and figures "from 0 1.04.2002" shall be substituted. 

By order and in the nann of the Governor of Chhattisgarh, 

lVVtAA~ 
(K.R. Misra) 

Deputy secretary 



--
8@1'<-i~I~ m~ 

fcffi:I" ~ .zfl\J11l ~111~1 
(ct1fcl1~ &> <-FR ~) 

'1~1c1ll 
~ cf>~ Io I ftf5 '.liq-=[, '<I~~'< 

~ . ~ b-lO- '2..e:>03 

~ ~-10/7/ /2003/cllco/'Cf['q ('2l7) - ~ ~ cR ~. 1956 (~ 74 

~ 1956), c#t cTffi 8 c#t ~ (5) mxl >Rm ~lfch-1ll'i cITT ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ mxT ~ 
~ c#t ~ ~ ~-3-28-2000-fctcn-"ClT"q (31), ~ 13.04.2000, ~ P!i:.--tljfllx ~ ~ 
t_ <lm, -

(i). 3ljwl-lic:b 1 ct X7TlR ~ (2) ~ ~- .. ~ (u:) ~ ~ ~ crm ~ .. ct ~ 
~ "crmwrrf (~) ~~~w ~ 1fcf ~ w~" cp1~~1 

(ii) 3ljwl-flc:b 2 ct X7TlR ~ (2) ~ ~. "m (£9:) ~ ~ ~ om ~ .. ct ~ 
~ "omwrf (m) ~~~W~~ t mzrr w~" cm~~I 

(iii). 3ljwl.1ic:b 3 ct ~ ~ (2) ~ ~- "ffi (u:) ~ ~ ~ om ~ .. ct ~ 
~ ''om wrrf (m) ~~ ~W 61m ~ ~ W 61IB'' cm~~I 

2. -qg ~ 16.01 .2001 ~ ~-~1c1~~ci Tfr-71 ~ I 
\:Pm"'l •i l ld ct -<l1..rll4IC'i ~ 1fl-f ~ r1m c. 

~ ) 

(~.3TR'. ~'ITT) 
~~ 

w:IT, ~ . , -{o - 2-00.3 
~ ~-10/7/ /2003/cllco/'Cf['q-~ ct~ ct ~ 348 ct~ (3) ct 3ljflx 0

1 "B, ~ 
~ c#t ~ ~ ~ - 10/7//2003/cffcp/'CJT'q (37). fGajcp~·(0·2..o<3 cpl~~ 

xlvll4IC'i ~ ~ ~. ~ mxl \.lc:bl~lc'1 fcl5<n UllcTI ~ I 



Government of Cbhattisgarh 
Finance and Planninu Department 

(Commercial Tax Department) 
Mantrala a 

Dau Kalyan Singh B~awan, Raipur 

NOTIFICATION 

Raipur, Oat\ d 6 -l o --i...oo _3 

No. F-10/ 71 /2003/CT N ( ?7) - In exerc ise of powers conferred by sub-section 
(5) of section 8 of the Central Sales Tax A t , 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State 
Government hereby makes the following amendments in this department Notification No. 
A-3-28-2000-ST-V (31), dated 13.04.2000, name y -

AMENDMENT 

In the Schedule to the said notification -

(i). In column (2 against serial o. 1 after the words "hoops and strips falling in 
cat gor (vi)" the \ ords "and fish plate bars and bearing plat bars falling in 

ategory (xii i)" shall be inserted. 

i i). In column 2) against serial No. 2 aft r the words "hoops and strips falling in 
category (vi " the words "an d fish plate bars and bearing plate bars falling in 
category xii i)" hat! be inserted. 

(iii). In column (2) against serial No. 3 afte· the words "hoops and strips falling in 
category (vi)" the words "and fish plate bars and bearing plate bars falling m 
category (xiii)'' shall be inserted. 

2. These amendments shall be deemed to hai e come into force with effect from 
16.01.2001. 

By order and in the riame of the Governor of Chhattisgarh, 

(K.R. Misra) 
Deputy secretary 



" th-'1 lfl 4 Id, ~lltF1 
f<ffif 'Q'ci mGt-11 ~ 
(ql~l~cf5 qJx ~'Sll'I) 

J.t-311 &1 lf 
G@> ct>~-1101 ftftr 1=fcFf, '< I .Q ~'< 

~. f~ ~-Io- "")_..t)f>_> 

~ ~-10/7/ /2003/qfcp/qfq ( /(JV) - c6'if1ll ~ cITT" ~, 1956 

(~ 14 ~ 19s6), ~ tITT"T a ~ '31ltITTT (s) m ~ ~1Fch-i<fi ~ m-<T 11 ~ ~ ~ 
-!·Hcf>I'<! ~&RT~ fct'+fTlT ~ ~ ~ "Cf(n-10/392/2001/ qJcp/~ (71), ~.--,icf> 12. 

11.2001, Tf f.i91jfil'<! ~ ~ 5- <l2TT, -

~ ~ <Bt 3-ljx-[T.Ji 11 -

(i). ~jw+1icb 1 cfi "fill=R ............... qJ@1,~ (2) "B ~ . "(0:) "B qfu@ ~ (fm ~- cfi q~iJltj 

~ "(f2TT ~ (cm-)~ ~11f1iC'l ~ ~ ~ ~ ~llR 11 ~ ~ " cITT ~~I 

2. Il5 ~ 10.08.2001 x{ ~-~lcH~C'l +=rAT ~ I 
£9 m"lfl 1 I d cfi ~.;: I v-~lj~q 1~&1 "$ -...,i-i:r x{ c=rm 3-11 ~ ~ 11 jfi I ( 

~-j 
{c5.3IR. ~*) 
'3q'~ 

~. ~ C - Io - ~ o_J 

~ ~-10/7/ /2003/qfcp/1:frq-~ cfi ~ cfi 3-lji:B~ 348 cfi ~ (3) cf> 3ljfix 0 1 
lf, ~ fcr:wr <BT~~ ~-10/7//2003 /qfcp/-qfij" (/6~), ~.--Jicf> 6·f0·2.e0_3 "45T 

~ ~ '{I\Tl!4IC'1 "cfi ~ ir, ~ &RT l,lcf-,)~la fcn<TT \JfIBT t: i 



Government.of Chhattisgarh 
Finance and Planning Department 

(Commercial Tax Department) 
Mantralaya 

I 
Dau _Kalyan Singh Br awan, Raipur 

NOTIFICATfION 

Raipur, D ted b -lo- 2--0 C?,_3 

No. F-10/ 7 / /2003/CTN ( /co) - In e Eircise of powers conferred by sub-section 
(5) of section 8 of the Central Sales Tax ct, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State 
Government hereby makes the following amendments in this department Notification No. 
F-10/392/2001/CT/V (71), dated 12.11.2001, n ely, -

AMENDMENT 

In the Schedule to the said notification -

(i). In column (2) against serial No. 1 after the words "hoops and strips falling in 
category (vi)'' the words "and fish plate1 bars and bearing plate bars falling in 

category (xiii)" shall be inserted. 

(ii). In column (2) against serial No. 2 after the words "hoops and strips falling in 
category (vi)" ·the words "and fish plate· bars and bearing plate bars falling in 
category (xiii)" shall be inserted. 

2. These amendments shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from 
10.08.2001. 

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh, 

(K.R. Misra) 
Deputy secretary 



/ 
,, 

" Ocr11'ti~ld ~lltl1 
~ ~ ~~\11"1 I ~ 
(q1fc)1~cf> cfR ~) 

Jl-311 t'-1 ll 
G@i cb<,i,ll I 01 ~ 1,cFf, '( I ti~'( 

~ . R--iirh G ~t =loc~ 

~ ~-10/ 7/ /2003/qlq)/-qi"=q ( /02-J - ch.-{ll! fcrnRT ~ ~. 1956 

(~ 74 ~ 1956), cnt ~ 8 cnt ~ (5) GTTT ~ ~lfcralll. cITT ~ if ~ ~ 
~ fi-<rhl-< ~ m ~cf~1a qmft ~ fcn ~ cB~"i;q fctW<l ~ ~. 1956, ~ ~ 
14 cf> ~ (~) cf> ffl (~) Tim (~) if cJfurn ~ Tim ~ cf> ~ 1R Vctt)fi'I~ 
cllfulRillrh ~ ~ . 1994 cf> 3@T@ ~ wTTfm ~ fi-~f%a fcnm 7Tm "ITT~~~ 
aa_q~iJlc't ~~"Ill ~ ~ ~. 1956, ctft ~ 14 cf> ~ ("'c!R) cf> ffl (~) if 
cffem ~ ~ ~ ~llR 11 ~ cf> frrrraT if (iql11• 1 fcnm vmrr t ITT~ fi-~ffia ~ 
~ xrftr ~ ~ ~ 1R cb~"lll ~ ~ ~ . 1956 cf>~ ~'BTffil iR cffc1I 
~ ctft xrftr ~ cpi:r ctft \JJ I ~ 'n I 

2. If6 ~ 16.01.2001 ~ .!:Pilcl~ftc1 ~ ~ Tim 31.03.2004 (1cp Wilcl~ftc1 

~I 

Vmifi•lct, cf> -.!l\.fll4lc1 cf> ~ ~ Tim 311~~11jfil( 

~) 

($.3ITT". fBm) 
~~ 

i'PITT'P l;"l>-1 o / 7 / / 2003 /<TT<!i /'W"I~~ ~~~~8 ~"'~(3) <ii 
3-ljfi=..t 01 if, ~ fcl1.wT ctft ~ ~ ~-10/71 /2003/qlq) ;-qt-q ( /c2J. 
ITTTcP (:--/c-2~o-i_, cf5T ~ ~ xl\J"ll4IC'i cf>~~. ~ 8RT \,1¢l~lci TTP<TT 
~ ~ I ---



Government of Chhattisgarh 
Finance and Planning Department 

(Commercial Tax D~partment) 
Mantralaya 

Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur 

NOTIFICAT ON 
I 

Raipur, Dated b ~~ 2 o 0__3 

No. F-10/7/ /2003/CTN ( lo 2-j - In ~xercise of powers conferred by sub­
section (5) of section 8 of the Central Sales Iax Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the 
State Government hereby directs that whereon the purchase of Iron and steel as 
specified in categories (ii) and (xvi) of claus1e (iv) of Section 14 of the Central 
Sales Tax Act, 1956, tax has been levied and collected under the Chhattisgarh 
Vanijyik Kar Adhiniyam, 1994 and if it is subsequently used in the manufacture of . . 

fish plates and bearing plates specified in cat 
I 
gory (xiii) of clause (iv) of Section 

14 of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956, then th amount of tax so collected shall be 
reduced from the tax leviable on sale of such finished product under the Central 
Sales Tax Act, 1956. 

1 This notification shall be deemed to h~ve come into force with effect from 
16.01.2001 and shall be in force upto 31.03 .20 4. 

By order and in the o me of the Governor ofChhattisgarh, 

1~~ 
(K.R. Misra) 

Deputy secretary 


	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 16-29.03.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 22-01.04.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 45-09.05.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 63-30.06.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 78-22.08.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 83-01.09.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 89-16.09.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 95-06.10.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 97-06.10.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 100-06.10.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 102-06.10.2003

