BdgiTe IE
faca a2 gre=n favmr
HATAY
<18 Bl Rig #ad, AR

SO :
AR, fadie 29-%-22073
HHF TH—10/ |§ /2003 /9% /uid / (1Q) — S fapa = affaw, 1956 (HHid
74 W7 1956) @ GRT 8 (5) §RT Uew WAl B YA § o gL AW WA Tag &N
e wames o & —

SNIEK
1. W @ g aftrgeeet ¥ e @ Wi ofe 20037 B UM W Sd 12004
gforenfid fy g —

1. U—3—28——2000—fd&—4Tg (38) ~ 17.04.2000
3 1973 /T% / 10—372 / 2001 / Ar6—4rd (51) 10.09.2001
3.  U%—10/385 /2001 /9% /Grd (60) 29.10.2001
4. TH—10 /391 /2001 /d1d /°4fa (65) 09.11.2001
5. U%—10/392 /2001 /41% /U4 (71) 12.11.2001
6. T%—10—16 /2002 / 9T /49 (16) 12.02.2002
% TH—10—29 /2002 / dTdh / Uid (38) 27.03.2002
8. UH—10 /43 / 2002 / aTd /Ot (54) N 02.05.2002
9. Uth—10—48 / 2002 / dT& / Uid (60) ' 21.05.2002
10.  U%H—10/15 /2002 /dTd /Uid (82) 16.07.2002
1.  U% /10—15 /2002 /a1 /U4 (83) 17.07.2002
12.  U%—10—67 /2002 /dTd /U (84) 23.07.2002
13,  U%H—10—72 /2002 /aTd /44 (91) 07.08.2002
14,  UH—10—95 /2002 /dTd /ufa (117) 28.12.2002

BTG & AU & 19 § AT ATRIATTER
S A R

I

(?ﬁ.am.ﬁ‘lm)b
Iy wfaa

AR oD 29-03-2 002

HHI® YBH—10/ (/2003 /A% /U4 /4 P9RA @ UM & Jw0Q 348 B WIS (3) B
FTERYT H, 39 famr ) sifRgE wHie 10/ 1& /2003 / aq1H/ urE /(L 6) Rie29-3-03
FT U FATE AU & UNDR I Yag &R WHIer f&an s €

BTG & AT B A1 F TAT QIR
B,‘Zg“il- e L '\1’5\;

—

(@ 31=_fisn)
Sy Afaa



Government of Chhattisgarh
Finance and Planning Department
Mantralaya
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhavan, RAIPUR

NOTIFICATION

Raipur, Dated 29 - 03 .96073

No.F-10/ A& /2003/CT/V( | &) - In exercise of Powers conferred by section 8 (5) of
Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (No.74 of 1956) the state government hereby makes the following
amendments:-

AMENDMENTS

1. In the notifications given below for the figure related to period "2003", the figure "2004"
shall be substituted: -

S.No. Notification No. Date
1 1685-F-10/332/2001/CT/V (38) 10.08.2001
2, 1973/F/10-372/2001/CT-V (51) 10.09.2001
3 F-10/385/2001/CT/V (60) 29.10.2001
4, F-10/391/2001/CT/V (65) 09.11.2001
5. F-10/392/2001/CT/V (71) 12.11.2001
6. F-10-16/2002/CT/V (16) 12.02.2002
7. F-10-29/2002/CT/V (38) 27.03.2002
8. F-10/43/2002/CT/V (54) 02.05.2002
9. F-10/48/2002/CT/V (60) 21.05.2002
10.  F-10/15/2002/CT/V (82) 16.07.2002
11.  F/10-15/2002/CT/V (83) 17.07.2002
12.  F-10-67/2002/CT/V (84) 23.07.2002
13.  F-10-72/2002/CT/V (91) 07.08.2002
14.  F-10-95/2002/CT/V (117) 28.12.2002

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh,

mef%/".___

(K.R. Misra)
Deputy Secretary



BadgiTe YITEA
faea aom e fasmr
HATAY
1% doarvl RHE HEH, IR

JrfergE
g, Raie | -4-2003

EHH UH—10 /926 /2003 /Tqd /Uia (22) — Tfh 98 IR D I8 AR
g1 T 2 fh i fRa # UHr &R A B, AAVd B [Aed R AWIH 1956
(BHTH 74 T 1956) BT GRT 8 &I IWRT (5) §RT Uged Afdadl HI YU H ld &Y
TR SR Udg gRI, ATAR] gRT STIRT (4) DY 3emsit &) gfed o= o), /a0 &1 18
IRE ® T (2) 7 RfAfde 9 @ @t @ Bem () § e dmr 9@, 9@
IgAl & ®eH (4) # faffde FEwst qon et & aeim 1 aWe, 2003 | 31 #7E,
2004 G P} HTAEED B AU PR S YA | GS Y& Bl & —

- S O
Eaa qEGT B gT @ A frdwer @en o R

S | | W=

(1) | (2 | (@) | (4)

1. | FOR greme | 3w 39 YR g @R @l -
| R UeaR 1 UATE 8§ S|

o 3@ UOR P @R & | =

| TR FEH 1 Ul @ Sy | B .

3 | @@eed I 39 UPR oG9 @Y Bl | 99 B I8 3 RYd
| R uegR 2 gw@ B S g e sEE g

L _ gdfed vd fafea g1

4
14

BRINTE @ IASTUTA & A1 § AT ATQATTAR,

L —
(@ .3m=. fasm)

Sy ufaq
MR, e | ~4- 2003
FHP. TH—10/Q e /2003 /dTd /UH—ARd & EAYH & JJe0g 348 & WU
(3) & 3rgERvl H, 39 T @) YR BHIG TH—10 / €/ 2003 /ATd / did (2A2),
fa=Tias |~Y-©3 &1 ST rare Iguid & UIPR A, Yag 2R Tbif3d fear S 2

BTG $ ATl & A1 qAT TR,

(@3mx. fasm)
Su wfuq



{
Government of C Jvattisgarh
Finance and Planning;Department
Mamral¥

Dau Kalyan Singh B fwan. Raipur

NOTIFICATION

Raipur, Dated |~ L-0s03

No. F-10/26 /2003/CT/V( 22) - Whereas, the State Government is satisfied that
it is necessary so to do in public interest:

Now, therefore. in exercise of powers conferred by sub section (5) of Section 8 of
the Central Sales Act. 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State Government hereby. on the
fulfillment of the requirements laid down in subsection (4). exempts the class of goods
specified in column (2) of the Schedule below from payment of tax under the said Act. to
the extent specified in column (3) for the period from 1st April, 2003 to 31st March, 2004
subject to the restrictions and conditions specified in column (4) of the said Schedule, -

SCHEDULE
'S. No. | Class of goods Extent of | Restrictions and  conditions
| Exemption subject to which exemption is
| _ granted o B |
L | (2) (3) (4) i
i Readymade garments Partly so as to B
reduce the rate
S - oftaxto1% —
2. | Jute cloth and jute twine | Partly so as to | .
' reduce the rate
: I of tax to 1% _ I
3. | Chemicals Partly so as to = When manufactured and soldvg_\:“
- reduce the rate | small-scale industries situated in
| ~ oftaxto2% | Chhattisgarh State.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chharttisgarh.

L;WV\X &3
(K.R.Misra)
Deputy secretary




BedaiTe S
faca e g faumr
HAT
1% Hearr Rig 9a+, IR

Srferga=
MR, s 09 - 05~ 2008

TS TH—10/35 /2003 /1% /Uid (46) — T o0 AN B I8 AR & 7T 8
& A fea # T1 ST avES B, Aqvd By ey BR AW 1956 (BHIB 74 T 1956)
B gRT 8 P! IYURT (5) §RT Wacd AT B 9@t § & §U I8 WBR Uag gRI, Faar)
ERT IUURT (4) 91 el @ gfd & &), i @ 78 g @ aem (2) # Rfafds ae &
a1t &1 drad (3) # faffde dmr 9@, Sa g @ oM (@) ¥ fAfafde fAd=ET gon odt @
RN o9 H g e | 31 Hid, 2004 OF B Hramaf @ fu e @ A ¥ 8e
UG @l § -

AggA .

TR BT Be @ A ‘ﬁﬁaawﬁﬁmﬁawﬁqwﬁgqﬁ;f
Sy YeH P TS B

—

@ () )

= =8 &

TGIR | 33T 39 UBR OEY BY P | 9 BaTE 99 § Red  ieiia 3are
SR HeHR 1 Ufawd 8 Y| | g Sodifed g9 fafbd &)

BAIEIS & ASUTd & A1 I AT AQIAMGAR,

AT —53)
@omx. ffom)

Sy wfug

iz 03 -05-2003
SHiPb. W10,/ 3D /2003 /dqTh /UFE—4Rd & T & BT 348 D @IS (3) D

ITERY #, g9 fPmT 3 @ sHie W10 /3572003 /9% /Ui (45), A 9-5.03F
UG AR T B UNGR |, vag gR1 gHIia fHar smar 2

BITe P NguTd & A1 F TUT AR,

N —— )

(@.3m=. fiysm)
Iu wfaa



Government of Chhattisgarh
Finance and Planning Department
Mantralaya
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur

NOTIFICATION
Raipur, Dated 09-05- 2003

No. F-10/3 4 2003/CT/V (4 5" ) - Whereas, the State Government is satisfied that it is
necessary so to do in public interest;

Now, therefore, in exercise of powers conferred by sub section (5) of Section 8 of the
Central Sales Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State Government hereby, on the fulfillment of the
requirements laid down in subsection (4), exempts the class of goods specified in column (2) of the
Schedule below from payment of tax under the said Act. to the extent specified in column (3) for
the period from the date of publication in official gazette to 31st March, 2004 subject to the
restrictions and conditions specified in column (4) of the said Schedule, -

SCHEDULE
S. Class of | Extent of Exemption | Restrictions and conditions subject to \as,rhicﬂh_ﬂ'I
No. | goods ; ] exemption is granted .
|

(| @& 3 ! (4) |
| 1. | Transformer | Partly so as to reduce the | When manufactured and sold by an industrial |
] l | rate of tax to 1 percent | unit situated in Chhattisgarh State. |

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh,

156{1/\/!3 <
(K.R. Misra)
Deputy secretary



BoITe EA
faca e arsaT fawmT
(arforfogs v fawm)

HATAY
1% BT Rig 7a¥, IR

SiferegaT

%‘_"ITES‘ 20— 6"105;

FHIH TH—10/5) /2003 /qF /Uid (63 ) — fd T50 AT B T8
A 8 79T 8 5 Ao fRa A V91 SR EeS ©, IIAUd Heig fdeg %
AMAFIH 1956 (FHID 74 T 1956) B ORI 8 Bl SWRT (5) ERT U AfFTAl &l
T A gU U WRDR Udg gRI SAfERIEAT HHIPG Th—10 /29 /2002 /A% /
uig (38) feAid 27.03.2002 #H fFFIHER R dell © —

weE
1. RS & SR W i 5 4 waigd ufafte @i faenfa fear sl -
2. g% HYEA 01.07.2003 ¥ guEdiad €0

BTG & oAU & A9 9§ Il TSR,

M
(@.31r. )
9y dfag

i 30-6—2° 072
FHI®. TH—10/¢) /2003 /ATh / Grd—HRTd @ A B T 348 D WS
(3) @ FgEReT ¥, 39 fawrT @Y fgE Bwie UH-10/$) /2008 /AT /Wi (63,
ﬁﬁfmgo*gzagma%ﬁmmaa%mﬁmmw@mﬁmm
2l

BARTTE @ ISIUTH B AW W AT MR,

M
(@3, fAsm)
Eil



Government of Chhattisgarh
Finance and Planning Department
(Commercial Tax Department)
Mantralaya
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur

NOTIFICATION

Raipur, Dated 3¢~ 6~ 292 -
No. F-10/ S| /2003/CT/V( ¢32, ) - Whereds, the State Government is
satisfied that it is necessary so to do in public interest;

Now, therefore, in exercise of powers conferred by sub section (5) of
Section 8 of the Central Sales Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State Government
hereby makes the following amendment in the notification No. F-10/29/2002/CT/V
(38) dated 27-03-2002 :-

AMENDMENT

b In the Schedule of the notification entry related to S.No. 5 shall be omitted.

2. This amendment shall come into force with effect from 01.07.2003.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh,

Lm&»\:{ o i

e—

(K.R. Misra)
Deputy secretary



BETe IET
faw ud orr fawurr
(oS v fawm)
HAGY
a1 Heur g wad, IR

SAERET
AR, feFi® 22, /08 /2003
 BHIE TH—10,/62,/2003 /16 /UE (18 ) — S fama ax affigw, 1956
(hHTH 74 FF 1956), ﬁwaﬁw()mmwﬁﬂu‘rﬁmﬁwﬁg
Y WRHR Tdg gl g@ fowr &1 sfegET He T—10 /392 /2001 / a1 /Ora
(71). feT® 12.41.2001, § AR GO Fe 2, Ter, —
GRS

TR ARLT D FTGA #, IFHAID 1 D AT FTad (4)([F) H ap v ¥ 2
gfaera” & I W 3F U9 e 1 ufrera” uferenfud fear we, vd

2. SFHHID 2 P WHA HIH (3) H ’Pb TG eg "2 G B ¥eH W b T4 Ued
"1 gferera” wfarenfad feam |

T8 G U H gheE e ¥ gyrasiier 8|

GEIGTE & IogITd & AH H qUT ATSSTAR,
AL~

e ——

(@3, fasm)
Iu wfuq

AR, fedisd 22 /08 /2003
FHIF, TH—10 /62 /2003 /476 /GO—ARA & WA & o 348 & @Us (3) &
FgERTT #, 39 fewWrT @ sRRgE HHe UH-10/62,/2003 /0% /94 (78 )
fasis 22~ /08 /2003 BT UG IATE IwTUTe & WIHGR W, Tag gR1 Fahifea fea
ST 2 |

BTHTE & oAUt @ A1 F TAT TR,

Cri;:——; A __...k__‘_j ‘]
@R fasm) il
39 gfga



Government of Chhattisgarh
Finance and Planning Department
(Commercial Tax Department)
Mantralaya
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur

NOTIFICATION

Raipur, Dated 272, /08/2003

No. F-10/62/2003/CT/V ( 7& ) - In exercise of powers conferred by sub-section
(5) of section 8 of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State
Government hereby makes the following amendments in this department Notification No.
F-10/392/2001/CT/V (71), dated 12.11.2001, namely, -

AMENDMENT

In the Schedule to the said notification, in column (4)(b) against serial No. 1 for the
figure "2%" the figure and word "1 percent" shall be substituted, and

2. In column (3) against serial No. 2 for the figure "2%" the figure and word "1
percent" shall be substituted.

These amendments shall come into force from the date of publication in official
gazette.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh.

|

| {W sy
(K.R.Misra)
Deputy secretary




BTG I
faca am arerEr faunT

(arforigs &x fawm)
AT
q1% Hedv Rig Wa+, QR

. SAEREET
0
R, w1 e, 2002,
$HId ThH—10/ 49 /2003 /dTd /Uid ( %) — T I5T AT B Y& YA & 731
e & de feaq # U &= amawds @ 3idyd fasha wx arfefram, 1956 (FHIH 74 |

1956) d1 URT 8 &I IUHRT (5) ERT Uacd WAfdTdl & YA H A §U Ao¥ WHR TG gRI
JARGET HH® TH—10 /49 /2003 / d1eh /dia (60) &I 23.06.2003 H FAFTTHR HMYA &l
B -

Iq AT B ATYA A IHHD (1) B WA bierd (4) 9 faffde Fdwm qen od
EGUESEARSIGUES

2. T8 A 01.09.2003 F YW@ BT |
BRIETE & A9gUTd $ A I JAT AR,

(@R, fAsm)
Y

gy, feiw | 7 2 s 208 2,
G TH-10 /49 /2003 /T1S /TA-9RE & WA & JIHWI 348 $ WUS (3) B AT
H, g9 fawrr & afgEeT wHiE UE—10/ 4¢ /2003 / A6 /U@ (83), [GA® (- 9-2090,@1
AT AT U @ TR ¥, Tag g1 Ghied fhar S 81
B P IdUTd B AT WA AR,

=)
e PO

(@3, fasm)
I



Government of Chhattisgarh
Finance and Planning Department
(Commercial Tax Department)

Mantralaya
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur

NOTIFICATION
Raipur, Dated ] S€pH 2005

No. F-10/ 49/ 2003/CT/V ( 8}) - Whereas, the State Government is satisfied that it is
necessary so to do in public interest;

Now, therefore, in exercise of powers conferred by sub-section 5 of Section § of the
Central Sales Tax Act, 1956, (No. 74 of 1956), the State Government hereby makes the
following amendment in the notification No. F-10/49/2003/CT/V (60) dated 23.06.2003 : -

AMENDMENT

In the schedule to the said notification, restrictions and conditions specified in column (4)
against serial No. (1) shall be omitted.

i This amendment shall come into force with effect from 01.09.2003.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh,

k!w_ CG\/-’Z
(K.R. Misra)
Deputy Secretary



BT T
faeq e g fawmT
(aforidaes v fawm)

HATAT
TS $dv Rig Had, IR

SR

' W?Wlb%?%ioﬁ})

HHIP Qtﬁ—‘m/g% /2003 /91 /914 (@Y ) qj% I I P TE
TAME 8 T § P o R A a1 R aews g, aaqaa‘ﬁﬁufamawa@ﬁm
1956 (SFHIH 74 G 1956) B! YR 8 &I IULRT (5) §RT Yaed Il &I YT A A gY
U WEHR Udg NI, ATHA! §RT SUURT (4) Y ardenenf &) g &vq ), 99 & 7
A & drem () # e 7@ & af &1 wem (3) ¥ fafifde dwr aw, S
I @ wr (4) # fRAfafde Fdwai qer vat @ sdfm oA # yeeE R9E 9
31.03.2004 d% B HTER P fIY HR & YA F B UG Al 8,—

3390

TGl BT B G fdfem qom o e ot v |

3
. | P Al gY B¢ USH 31 TS 8
(1

) (3) (4) J
1. |U®e AT 3 UPR R arT 8 | 94 Uofipd agadrs off g H Rerd |
I B STRT (1) & 9 R A agﬁﬁumés‘f@t{a‘mﬁﬂmﬁ
T gTHR 1 gfawrd & o | Uoflrd B BRI W/ @lfET
qgdrdq &9l Wy | |

BRINTTE & g & AH | TR ARATR,

(@3, A=)
39 wfug

MR, A /G%Pd‘aﬂ-l@“)
FHIG TH—10/4R /2003 /a1 / GiEg-9Rd & wfau aﬁrn@‘c: 348 B WUS (3)

& FER H, g9 fawmT @ AgE e Uh-10/8% /2003 /91d /WA (89 ),
festia 16)2/02, @1 SIS SrgaTe WoUUTe @ WRIGR W, Tag gRT WHIRIa fhar o 2 |

BRI @ ISUUTd & A1 9 oIl AQUTTHR,

Nzv—)

(@ s
Iy wafeq



-~ Government-of Chhattisgarh
Finance and Planning Department
(Commercial Tax Department)
Mantralaya
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur

NOTIFICATION

Raipur, Dated /6 Sept. 202

No. F-10/ 6% /2003/CT/V( 89 ) - Whereas, the State Government is satisfied
that it is necessary so to do in public interest;

Now, therefore, in exercise of powers conferred by sub section (5) of Section

8 of the Central Sales Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State Government hereby, on

the fulfillment of the requirements laid down in subsection (4), exempts the class of

goods specified in column (2) of the Schedule below from payment of tax under the

i said Act, to the extent specified in column (3) for the period from the date of

—————publication in official gazette to 31.03.2004, subject to the restrictions and
conditions specified in column (4) of the said Schedule,-

SCHEDULE
S. |Class of | Extent of Exemption | Restrictions and conditions subject to
No. | goods which exemption is granted
) (2) 3) “)
1. | Packet Partly so as to reduce | When sold by a registered dealer after
Tea the rate of tax under | processing/ blending who is a small-

sub-section (1) of|scale unit situated in the state and
Section 8 to 1 percent | registered in industries department.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh,
A

Corrrs 5 e S
(K.R. Misra)
Deputy secretary



BiNTe ITEH
faca e are=r AT
(@ferisas &x fawm)

HATAY
<% Bl Rig e, AR

AR, foAi® &-o— 2003

HHE TH—10/ 70 /2003/d6 /U@ (S ) — i I50 ARE B U8 GEEE 8
T & % e Ra # U @Al s © Iavd By ey R fRfgH 1956 (SFHIG 74 G
1956) @] GRT 8 @I TULRT (5) §RT Ued Wfdqal d ganT # o g ST WRGR TAg gRT
m&xﬁ:@g HHIG THE—10/29,/2002/d1%. /dfd (119) 716 31122002 # f=remR denfda
GHICE
I ARgE # Rl IO P USIE A F B W G bl Td TG 101.04.2002
[ e & g |

TRIGTE B YU & A | TAT SRATTIR,

A g

—

(®.3m=. fiysm)
SU bf¥g

R, f7d £~ lo— 2003

FHIEH Th—10,/ 7C /2003 /qF /UE—HRE & WA & IIDT 348 S WIS (3) B AT H,
T T @) e B9% TH—10/ 7 /2003 /a® /utE (RST), RAG£4o0-2003
SN SrETE TadTe B WRER W, TAg gRT Y G o g1

BT & ISTUTA B AW R FAT ARITTAR
m g t— <)

(®.am=. fAsm)
3u |fe




Government of Chhattisgarh
Finance and Planning Department
(Commercial Tax Department)
Mantralaya
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur

NOTIFICATION

Raipur, Dated E-10- 2003

No. F-10/ 7¢ /2003/CT/V ( QS ) - Whereas, the State Government is
satisfied that it is necessary so to do in public interest;

Now, therefore, in exercise of powers conferred by sub-section (5) of Section 8
of Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State Government hereby makes
the following amendment in the Notification No. F/10-29/2002/CT/V (119), dated
31-12-2002:-

AMENDMENT

In the said notification for the words "from the date of publication in gazette"
the words and figures "from 01.04.2002" shall be substituted.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh,

A o>
(K.R. Misra)
Deputy secretary



BigTe AT
fac wd Frer fawm
(anforius & fwm)

HATTg
T BV R 9aH, AR

SHfErRgET

AR, fAd £—1o0~ 2003

HHIH TH—10/77/) /2003 /A6 /Ui (D] ) — b7 faa F= ARfTm, 1956 (FH® 74

H 1956), DI IRT 8 DI IUYRT (5) §RT Yaed ATl S YART # A Y 99 WRBR TAg gNT 39

?‘*WT DI ARYT HHID [—3—28—2000—FdH—uTa (31), fRH1E 13.04.2000, # FFTHITIR T B!
. JoIT, —

I ARRFET B I A -

(). SIHAEIG 1 B AW FeM (2) | T,
W"ﬁ@ﬂ@ﬁ(ﬁgﬁ)ﬁwﬁaﬁmﬁeaﬁ@wﬁv
K

hn

(ii). szﬁwﬁw@)
TeE] AT yar (AvE) ® wifie Y wie arré@éaﬁfr

(iii). STIHHID 3 B THA DI (2) H WD, I () H WA TH TA L D G
yregt g yait (GRE) # wfie e wie o Ud 9T Wi 9 @l S 9 |

g g I 16.01.2001 ¥ GH1@eA AT S0 |
BRIATE & ogulel & AW ¥ 207 Aear

(@3, )
I9 wfea
R, TFE 619 ~2003
U TH—10/77/ /2003 /AT / UA—ARA & WA & JIDE 348 d TS (3) B IOV #, 9
farmr @ SifeRgET HHIB TH-10/°7// 2008 /1% /9d (F7), ’RTAH € -(0- 2003 H1 AU JqaTE
AU @ YIRSR ¥, Udg g1 Y f&ar Siar 2 |

TG D ASTUTA B A ¥ TUT ATQYTAR,

S A3
@ e
Sq |fra



Government of Chhattisgarh
Finance and Planning Department
(Commercial Tax Department)
Mantralaya
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur

NOTIFICATION

Raipur, Dated ¢ —( o —.00 3

No. F-10/77) /2003/CT/V ( ) - In exercise of powers conferred by sub-section

(5) of section 8 of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State
Government hereby makes the following amendments in this department Notification No.
A-3-28-2000-ST-V (31), dated 13.04.2000, namely, -

AMENDMENT

In the Schedule to the said notification -

”

(1). Incolumn (2) against serial No. 1 after the words "hoops and strips falling in
category (vi)" the words "and fish plate bars and bearing plate bars falling in
category (xiii)" shall be inserted.

(11). In column (2) against serial No. 2 after the words "hoops and strips falling in
category (vi)" the words "and fish plate bars and bearing plate bars falling in
category (xiii)" shall be inserted.

(iii). In column (2) against serial No. 3 after the words "hoops and strips falling in
category (vi)" the words "and fish plate bars and bearing plate bars falling in

category (xiii)" shall be inserted.

These amendments shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from

16.01.2001.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh,

}

(K.R. Misra)
Deputy secretary



LERUGRIEINIEE
fac g Ao T
(@foroas @R fawm)

HATAT
% S fHE ¥ad, \AR

SHfergErT
TR, oA €-to— 2003

HHIH TH—10/"7) /2003/dq1% /49 ( /o©) — D= fama v i, 1956
(BHId 74 | 1956), DI URT 8 B IUERT (5) ERT Uaed wfeadl &1 W™ # &d gU I
WXHR YA gRT 39 f3RT &1 AT 596 UH—10 /392 /2001 / aT® /Uta (71), f&1i® 12,
112001, § IR Heee &rcl @, 31, —

GNICE]
I AGIAT D ST H —

(i). orHH® 1 F qEA Prod (2) § weEl, (w) H aftfa g9 aur I B o
Teel AT T (Rg) H it Y wie 9% vd uikT wie e &1 @rel Wi |

(il). gHF® 2 & WHA HIe¥ (2) ¥ =], (&) # aftid g 9 T’ & 9vE
gl aAT yait (k) A e e wie 9 ud 9afRT wie g’ #I SiTsT Wi |

2 TE MU 10.08.2001 H FHTGLiel HAHT SIYHT |
BRIETE & IoUUTd & A | Tl MRYTAR,

il |
(PR, fysn)
SEESICE]

W, fodie €-/0 - 2003
FHHIE TH—10/7) /2003 /4T /UE—URA & AAUH & T 348 T TUS (3) B ATV
¥ 39 U @) IfRETT HHG Th—10 /7) /2003 /416 /Ui (/6¢), f&ATE 6-10-2003 &I
S SATE T & WIRGR &, Udg R JHI3d fdar Sirar g |

BETE & JSqUTd & A1 F T AQYUTIR,

oN o—*9
(@.31R. fasm)
U afg




Government of Chhattisgarh
Finance and Planning Department
(Commercial Tax Department)
Mantralaya
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur

NOTIFICATION

Raipur, Dated & —-/0- 29202

No. F-10/77/ /2003/CT/V ( Je© ) - In exercise of powers conferred by sub-section
(5) of section 8 of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the State

Government hereby makes the following amendments in this department Notification No.
F-10/392/2001/CT/V (71), dated 12.11.2001, namely, -

AMENDMENT

In the Schedule to the said notification -

(i). Incolumn (2) against serial No. 1 after the words "hoops and strips falling in
category (vi)" the words "and fish plate bars and bearing plate bars falling in
category (xiii)" shall be inserted.

(i1). In column (2) against serial No. 2 after the words "hoops and strips falling in
category (vi)" the words "and fish plate bars and bearing plate bars falling in
category (xiii)" shall be inserted.

z These amendments shall be deemed to have come into force with effect trom
10.08.2001.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh,

(

pmﬁh i
(K.R. Misra)
Deputy secretary



BTe ITE
EoREEISEIREEIR
(@frfoas & famm)

HATY

TS ST g Haq, QR

ez
AR, ERIED < wr Qea}

$HHd TH—10/ 7) /2003 /416 /Ui (Jo2) — D14 faha w fDfaH, 1956
(PHI® 74 T 1956), DI URT 8 DI SUHRT (5) ERT Yo il HT FAT H & §U
Y WHR Tdg gRI R &l @ & S8f a=dg faswg o= aififam, 1956, @ emr
14 & @Ue (AR) & Ui (]1) dA1 (M) # afvfa i aom sud & $Hd W BNE
qifoigd &R AfRIfaH, 1994 & ofavfa &) wiRa va wufead far wam 8 vgd afe =
qauear d=1a fahg o &g, 1956, BT URT 14 & @S (IR) & Yait (@=g) A
aftfa fiber wicw vd R wiew & i § Suar fear orar ®, a9 0f qufa &)
o fY 0 AT Sae R e fama e sfafsas, 1956 & siaefa uwiRa 8 arelt
B DI AR I B DT STgT |

2. UG ARREAT 16.012001 ¥ UAEIA A WO FAT 31.03.2004 qH GHGEA
Zefl |

BINTE & VS8UTd & 1 | qUT RHAR,

T
(®.31R. fHsm)
SLESIEE]
T B ygmeic, e
HAG TH—10/ 7) /2003 /dld /GA—9Rd & H A B IO 348 b @3) ®

SFEREl #, 39 favmT @ siftgEe @HiE TB-10/ 7 /2003 /41 /Ui ( f02.),
feid ¢~)c-Deo, BT ST MAE To0UTH & UIGR &, Tag &R Yh1iRE fear
ST 2 -

BARNTE & ISUUTA & 9/ | AT AU,

(@ 3R, fAsm)
IU g



Government of Chhattisgarh
Finance and Planning Department
(Commercial Tax Department)
Mantralaya
Dau Kalyan Singh Bhawan, Raipur

NOTIFICATION

Raipur, Dated & (2 207,

No. F-10/77) /2003/CT/V ( /e 2} - In exercise of powers conferred by sub-
section (5) of section 8 of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), the
State Government hereby directs that whereon the purchase of Iron and steel as
specified in categories (ii) and (xvi) of clause (iv) of Section 14 of the Central
Sales Tax Act, 1956, tax has been levied and collected under the Chhattisgarh
Vanijyik Kar Adhiniyam, 1994 and if it is subsequently used in the manufacture of
fish plates and bearing plates specified in category (xiii) of clause (iv) of Section
14 of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956, then the amount of tax so collected shall be

reduced from the tax leviable on sale of such finished product under the Central
Sales Tax Act, 1956.

Y, This notification shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from
16.01.2001 and shall be inforce upto 31.03.2004.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Chhattisgarh,

|

Orms—~ 7
(K.R. Misra)
Deputy secretary



	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 16-29.03.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 22-01.04.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 45-09.05.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 63-30.06.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 78-22.08.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 83-01.09.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 89-16.09.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 95-06.10.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 97-06.10.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 100-06.10.2003
	Subject-Central Sales Tax Adhisuchna No. 102-06.10.2003

