It |, S1.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

Y.5M.-8).0e.-31.-07032020-218572
CG-DL-E-07032020-218572

AETETIT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | —a@ve 3—9-g%< (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (ii)

TTFRRT & THTIATT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
§. 883] ¢ feelY, gEeafaaTe, " 5, 2020/%T 15, 1941
No. 883] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, MARCH 5, 2020/PHALGUNA 15, 1941

CILEERIGE R IR D

st
¢ faeeft, 29, 2020

F.3. 987(3T).—Fara Y, fAw™ aga srfafa=m, 1972 (1972 #7 69) Fir &I 4% Y
STLTT (6) FTRT Y& AT HT TN Fd U ST 39 ATAHIH Al rELT ATLAT % T 3 &%
R 24 % g § g afAREe & e #w e § TEee qor Rerdt g "entae # T
aT3re AT HATH T T F F O T sreTe srerar qHi=e auwa g, 78 e Srh w7
T =9 ATIg=eT & TSI § YHIT g A g F 3Fd ATAIH BT T SATLAT o LT
eI "errterd g, srerie -
1. A9 21 9 Sufaaw (1) #, “UF a1@ dE g1 UF 91 90541 & €19 T, “UF q1E Ag=d
T AT |1 TH” 9Tl T TET STUAT ;
2. fAaw 22 #,--

(F) ITF=T (1) §, “FTX g T A7 A=A sl % T I, “07= go1¥ a1 a7 fameha”
TsaT T TET STTUAT;

(@) U (2) H, ‘U AT UF Al THAH 1T 6 €9 U, “Ueh o< &l 61 AT «Taaf

T T@T STTOAT ;
1288 G1/2020 (1)




2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

(M) SUFRIH (3) |, “I+E" eTeal % TIH I, “qTeq” Te TET STUAT |
[T, TH-11012/9/97-1(F.3)]
HMATAT TEARIT, T T
feroqur: e agw sfarfam, 1972 % e sa=t % e 21 v 22 ¥ siafdse arfae St
STErE=AT HeTTF F1.30. 2159, TG 16 A, 2016 FTRT Tgel ot Ferrfara & mam =1 |

MINISTRY OF CIVIL AVIATION
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 2nd March, 2020

S.0. 987(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (6) of section 4A of the Carriage by
Air Act, 1972 (69 of 1972) and pursuant to rule 24 of Chapter Ill of the Third Schedule to the said Act, the
Central Government, having regard to the provisions of the said Act, and considering it necessary or expedient
to give effect to the limits of liability as revised by the depositary, hereby directs that with effect from the date
of publication of this notification in the Official Gazette, the provisions of the Third Schedule of the said Act
shall stand amended as follows, namely: —

1. In rule 21, in sub-rule (1), for the words “one lakh thirteen thousand one hundred”, the words “one lakh
twenty-eight thousand eight hundred twenty-one” shall be substituted;

2. Inrule 22, —

(@ in sub-rule (1), for the words “four thousand six hundred and ninety four”, the words “five
thousand three hundred forty-six™ shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (2), for the words “one thousand one hundred and thirty one”, the words “one thousand
two hundred eighty-eight” shall be substituted; and

(c) in sub-rule (3), for the word “nineteen”, the words “twenty-two” shall be substituted.

[F. No. AV-11012/9/97-A (Vol.1I1)]
ANGSHUMALI RASTOGI, Jt. Secy.

Note : The liability limits contained in rules 21 and 22 of the Third Schedule to the Carriage by Air Act, 1972
(69 of 1972) were earlier revised vide notification number S.0. 2159 dated the 16th June, 2016.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. MANOJ KUMAR VERMA Btz s enss



		2020-03-07T15:55:14+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




