
Regd. No. WB/SC-247 	 No.WB/CPS/Raj-16(Part 111)12005 

 

Tbt 

 

Rothata a3ette 

 

14-*Pr 
Extraordinary 

Published by Authority 

 

BHADRA 14 ] MONDAY, SEPTEMBER 5, 2005 [SAKA 1927 

  

PART III— Acts of the West Bengal Legislature 

GOVERNMENT OF WEST BENGAL 

LAW DEPARTMENT 

Legislative 

NO111-1CATION 

No. 2128-L.— 5th September, 2005.—The following Act of the West Bengal Legislature, having been assented to by the 
Governor, is hereby published for general information :— 

West Bengal Act XXII of 2005 
THE WEST BENGAL STATE HEALTH SERVICE (AMENDMENT)ACT, 2005. 

[Passed by the West Bengal Legislature.] 

[Assent of the Governor was first published in the Kolkata Gazette, Extraordinary, 
of the 5th September, 2005.] 

Short title and 
commencement. 

Substitution of 
new section for 
section 6 in West 
Ben. Act VII of 
1990. 

An Act to amend the West Bengal State Health Service Act, 1990. 

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the West Bengal State Health Service 
Act, 1990, for the purposes and in the manner hereinafter appearing ; 

It is hereby enacted in the Fifty-sixth Year of the Republic of India, by the 
Legislature of West Bengal, as follows :- 

1. (1) This Act may be called the West Bengal State Health Service 
(Amendment) Act, 2005. 

(2) It shall come into force at once. 

2. In the West Bengal State Health Service Act, 1990 (hereinafter referred 
to as the principal Act), for section 6, the following section shall be substituted :— 

"Medical Colleges where a 6. The State Government may, by notification, 
person holding post in the declare any undergraduate or post-graduate cadre of the West Bengal 
Medical Education Service or Medical College or other teaching institution 
the West Bengal Health together with the Hospital, if any, attached to 
Service may exercise option such Medical College or institution to be an for practice. 

institution where a person holding such post in 
the cadre of the West Bengal Medical Education Service or the West 

22 

West Ben. 
Act VII of 
1990. 



23] THE KOLKATA GAZE 1' 1E, EXTRAORDINARY, SEPTEMBER 5, 2005 	 [PART DI 

The West Bengal State Health Service (Amendment) Act, 2005. 

(Sections 3-5.) 

Bengal Health Service, on such terms and conditions, as may be prescribed, 
may exercise option for practice.". 

Substitution of 	3. For section 9 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted:— 
new section for 	 "Posts in the cadre of 9. (1) The cadre of the West Bengal Medical Education 
section 9. 	 West Bengal Medical Service shall consist of non-practising posts, as may Education Service. 

be prescribed, and shall include certain posts where 
practising option may be available, on such terms and conditions, as may be 
prescribed. 

(2) Any person appointed to a non-practising post included in the cadre 
of the West Bengal Medical Education Service, or any person, who opts for 
practice but not permitted to practice, may be granted such non-practising 
allowance as may be prescribed.". 

4. In section 14 of the principal Act,— 
(1) in sub-section (1), in clause (a) of the second proviso, for the words 

"fifteen years", the words "eighteen years" shall be substituted; 
(2) in sub-section (2A), in the second proviso, for the figures, letters 

and words "24th day of May, 2005.", the figures, letters and words 
"24th day of May, 2008." shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 	5. In section 19A of the principal Act,— 
section 19A. 

	

	 (1) for the words "fifteen years", the words "eighteen years" shall be 
substituted; 

(2) for the figures, letters and words "24th day of May, 2005.", the 
figures, letters and words "24th day of May, 2007." shall be 
substituted. 

By order of the Governor, 

MD. HESAMUDDIN, 
Secy.-in-charge to the Govt. of West Bengal, 

Law Department. 

P: ;Niched h‘ the r, 'moiler of Printing & Stational:, West Bentlal and printed 	Assn. Supdt. at "Secretor:, to the box emor's Press. Ral B no \ in Kolkata 

Amendment of 
section 14. 


	Page 1
	Page 2

