Extraordinary
Published by Authority

WEDNESDAY, AUGUST 27, 2003 [SAKA 1925

PART ITI—Acts of the West Bengal Legislature.
GOVERNMENT OF WEST BENGAL
LAWDEPARTMENT
Legislative
NOTIFICATION

No: ~14] 7-L.—27th August, 2003 —The following Act of the West Bengal Legislature, having been assented to by the
Governor, is! hereby published for general information :—

Short title and
commencement. 2003

j Amendmen! of
section 6 of West (hereinafter referred to as the pnnmpa.l Act), after the third proviso, the followmg provxs shall be
Ben. Act VII of adqded:— -

‘Amendment of

Amendment of

Amendment of

P | West Bengal Act XXII of 2003
. WEST BENGAL STATE HEALTH SERVICE

;S,tate Hcalth Service Act, 1990, forthe  West Ben.
L 5 Act V11

(2) It shall come into force at once. _
2. In sub-section (2) of section 6 of the West Bengal State Health Service Act 1990

“Provided also that it shall be the duty of a person, holding teaching post in any of the non-
practising institutions as laid down in sub-section (1), to render, in addition to his own duties,
patient care services in the Poly Clinics or Pay Clinics run in'such non-practising institutions.”.

3. Insection 14 of the principal Act,—

(I) in sub—sectlon (1), in clause (a) of the second proviso, for the words “eleven
years”, the words “fifteen years” shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (24), in the second proviso, for the figures, letters and words
“24th day of May, 2001.”, the figures, letters and words “24th day of May, 2005.” -
shall be substituted.

4. In the proviso to section 19A of the principal Act, for the words “eleven years”, the
words “fifteen years™ shall be substituted.

5. In the proviso to section 22 of the principal Act, for the words “eleven years”, the
words “fifteen years” shall be substituted. :

6. Anything done or any action taken under the principal Act as amended by this Acr?
before the publication of this Act in the Official Gazette shall be deemed to have been vahdly% s

such thing was done or such action was taken.

N 37




	Page 1

